

Group No.	Item No.	Room Name	Est. Qty.	Description/Specification	Spec. Make/Model	Diversified Education Systems, Inc. Middleburg, VA			Douron, Inc. Owings Mills, MD			Glover Furniture and Design Group, Inc. Cockeysville, MD			Hyperspace, LLC Hagerstown, MD			Lakeshore Learning Materials Carson, CA			School Specialty, Inc. Mansfield, OH			Washington Office Interiors, LLC Rockville, MD		
						Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price
I	1	Pre-K	50	Chairs for Classroom, 4-leg; polypropylene; seat height is 12/13"H.	KI+F3:F12 Intellect Wave -IW413	KI+F3:F12 Intellect Wave -IW413	\$ 62.16	\$ 3,108.00	KI8 IW413	\$ 48.99	\$ 2,449.50	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 54.23	\$ 2,711.50	HON Smartlink HSS4L-12A	\$ 85.68	\$ 4,284.00	LAKESHORE CN812BU	\$ 30.68	\$ 1,534.00	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	KI Intellect Wave -IW413	\$ 69.02	\$ 3,451.00
I	2	Various	574	Chairs for Classroom, 4-leg; polypropylene; seat height is 15"H.	KI Intellect Wave -IW415	KI Intellect Wave -IW415	\$ 62.79	\$ 36,041.46	KI IW415	\$ 50.10	\$ 28,757.40	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 54.02	\$ 31,007.48	HON Smartlink HSS4L-16B	\$ 88.47	\$ 50,781.78	LAKESHORE CN816U	\$ 41.84	\$ 24,016.16	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	KI Intellect Wave -IW415	\$ 69.51	\$ 39,898.74
I	3	Various	16	Chairs for Classroom, 4-leg; polypropylene; seat height is 18"H.	KI Intellect Wave -IW418	KI Intellect Wave -IW418	\$ 62.79	\$ 1,004.64	KI 418	\$ 50.10	\$ 801.60	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 54.69	\$ 875.04	HON Smartlink HSS4L-18B	\$ 88.47	\$ 1,415.52	LAKESHORE CN818BU	\$ 46.49	\$ 743.84	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	KI Intellect Wave -IW418	\$ 69.51	\$ 1,112.16
I	4	Various	35	Chair, teacher task, upholstered back, memory foam seat; w/adj. arms; back height adjustment; casters for hard surfaces; (for desk)	KI ENG MU/AA	KI ENG MU/AA	\$ 803.59	\$ 28,125.65	KI ENG MU/AA	\$ 575.00	\$ 20,125.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 667.00	\$ 23,345.00	HON Ignition HIWM2	\$ 344.11	\$ 12,043.85	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	KI ENG MU/AA	\$ 711.34	\$ 24,896.90	
I	5	Various	28	Desk, steel, rectangular 24 X 48" X 66"; full modesty panel, two full end panels; single ped w/box/file drawer.	KI WZTD244866-74P-R	KI WZTD244866-74P-R	\$ 1,042.71	\$ 29,195.88	KI WZTD244866-74P-R	\$ 746.00	\$ 20,888.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 862.68	\$ 24,155.04	Steelcase Answer Freestanding	\$ 1,410.16	\$ 39,484.48	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	KI WZTD244866-74P-R	\$ 826.56	\$ 23,143.68	
I	6	Pre-K & SWD and 3 Offices	7	Desk, steel, rectangular 30 X 54"; full modesty panel, two full end panels; single ped w/box/file drawer.	KI RF3054/F w/drawers	KI RF3054/F w/drawers	\$ 1,042.71	\$ 7,298.97	KI RF3054/F	\$ 746.00	\$ 5,222.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 862.68	\$ 6,038.76	Steelcase Answer Freestanding	\$ 913.52	\$ 6,394.64	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	KI RF3054/F w/drawers	\$ 847.56	\$ 5,932.92	
I	7	SWD 121 & 212	9	Task chair, student, adjustable height, medium size for elementary students, hard floor casters, polypropylene contoured shell.	KI IWPD15	KI IWPD15	\$ 114.71	\$ 1,032.39	KI IWPD15	\$ 91.00	\$ 819.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 104.17	\$ 937.53	HON Smartlink HSSTK-18B	\$ 137.54	\$ 1,237.86	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	KI IWPD15	\$ 109.20	\$ 982.80	
I	8	Various	25	Chair, armless, upholstered seat and back; tilt; casters for hard surface; adj. hgt. teacher for reading table	KI IWPD18TU/B	KI IWPD18TU/B	\$ 222.62	\$ 5,565.50	KI IWPD18TU/B	\$ 177.00	\$ 4,425.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 191.43	\$ 4,785.75	HON Ignition HIWM2	\$ 311.97	\$ 7,799.25	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	KI IWPD18TU/B	\$ 192.99	\$ 4,824.75	
I	9	Various	290	Student desk, adjustable height; trapezoid hard plastic top is 26" X 19" w/plastic book box; 15-year warranty; ships from factory assembled.	KI Intellect Wave IWDTFL/A w/BB	KI Intellect Wave IWDTFL/A w/BB	\$ 130.02	\$ 37,705.80	KI IWDTFL/A w/BB	\$ 103.00	\$ 29,870.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 113.44	\$ 32,897.60	HON Smartlink HLDV-M3A	\$ 346.25	\$ 100,412.50	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	KI Intellect Wave IWDTFL/A w/BB	\$ 121.45	\$ 35,220.50	
I	10	SWDs	5	Desk, student; wheel chair accessible, adj. height w/bookbox - 33 X 20" hard plastic top	KI IWD4FH/ADA	KI IWD4FH/ADA	\$ 145.24	\$ 726.20	KI IWD4FH/ADA	\$ 115.00	\$ 575.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 127.27	\$ 636.35	No Bid	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	KI IWD4FH/ADA	\$ 133.21	\$ 666.05		
GROUP I TOTAL:							\$ 149,804.49		\$ 113,932.50		\$ 127,390.05		\$ 223,853.88		\$ -		\$ -		\$ -		\$ -		\$ 140,129.50			

FORM OF PROPOSAL - PART B - Bid 2016-45, Furniture for Jonathan Hager Elementary School

Group No.	Item No.	Room Name	Est. Qty.	Description/Specification	Spec. Make/Model	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	
II	11	Café	6	Transport truck for metal folding chairs; 7-gauge main frame; 14-gauge cross braces;16-gauge hanging rods; Heavy duty caster features 325lb. weight capacity and measures 4" x 1 1/4"; swivel wheels for easy gliding; brown powder coated steel; castors; capacity: 84 chairs.	National Public Seating #84 Blue	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	NPS 84	\$ 246.00	\$ 1,476.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 259.77	\$ 1,558.62	Hertz Furniture HCT-505-HD	\$ 315.82	\$ 1,894.92	NO BID	\$ -	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 261.40	\$ 1,568.40	NO BID	\$ -
II	12	Music	24	Music posture chair, black; 7/8" frame with 16-gauge square tubing; 14-gauge rear seat brace; band-pitch style with a seat back angle of 97 degrees; polypropylene contoured seat; can be stacked 18 high; weighs 12 lbs; non-marring polyethylene glides; dimensions, overall: 33 1/2"H x 19"W x 21 1/2"D and seat: 17 1/2"H x 16 1/2"W x 16 1/2"D.	National Public Seating #8210	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	NPS 8210	\$ 51.00	\$ 1,224.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 58.91	\$ 1,413.84	No Bid	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 50.00	\$ 1,200.00	NO BID	\$ -	
II	13	Music	30	Music stand, 18 gauge, 1" O.D. steel; tension tilt surface; powdered-coated in black; dimensions 20 1/2" X 12 1/2" L and adjusts from 24 - 46".	National Public Seating 82MS	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	NPS 82MS	\$ 30.00	\$ 900.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 39.72	\$ 1,191.60	No Bid	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 30.31	\$ 909.30	NO BID	\$ -	
II	14	Music	1	Music stand dolly	National Public Seating DYMS20	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	NPS OYMS20	\$ 261.00	\$ 261.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 282.99	\$ 282.99	No Bid	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 252.71	\$ 252.71	NO BID	\$ -	
II	15	Music	1	Music posture chair dolly; 16-gauge, 3/4" round handles; 17-gauge, 7/8" square frame;Stacks up to 18 series #8200 chairs;4 casters; Two swivel, two non-swivel. 1 1/2"; Ship weight: 24 lbs;Chrome-plated steel	National Public Seating DY82	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	NPS OY82	\$ 133.00	\$ 133.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 148.46	\$ 148.46	No Bid	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 151.01	\$ 151.01	NO BID	\$ -	
II	16	Café	500	Chairs, metal folding, blue; dimensions: overall: 29 1/4"H x 18"W x 19 1/2"D; folded: 37 3/4"H x 18 1/8"W x 2"D; seat: 17 1/4"H x 16"W x 16"D; back: 7"H x 17 7/8"W; commercial quality.	National Public Seating #900	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	NPS 900	\$ 11.88	\$ 5,940.00		\$ 15.34	\$ 7,670.00	Hertz Furniture FHC-200	\$ 18.26	\$ 9,130.00	NO BID	\$ -	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 12.90	\$ 6,450.00	NO BID	\$ -
				GROUP II TOTAL:			\$ -	\$ -			\$ 9,934.00		\$ 12,265.51		\$ 11,024.92		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 10,531.42	NO BID	\$ -		

FORM OF PROPOSAL - PART B - Bid 2016-45, Furniture for Jonathan Hager Elementary School

Group No.	Item No.	Room Name	Est. Qty.	Description/Specification	Spec. Make/Model	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price		
III	17	Music	1	Podium, folding, for instructor in music classes; laminated plywood sides lock into position.	Wenger	Wenger	\$ 525.10	\$ 525.10	Wenger #0211L002	\$ 493.00	\$ 493.00				Wenger	\$ 452.35	\$ 452.35	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -
III	18	Music	5	Riser/platform for music classroom/stage; 3-step; molded hand holds; built-in recessed wheels; plastic construction; textured for traction; can be used for stable seating or standing risers for performances.	Wenger 025D002 Blue/Black	Wenger 025D0002 Blue	\$ 1,035.43	\$ 5,177.15	Wenger 0250002	\$ 922.00	\$ 4,610.00				Wenger 025D002 Blue/Black	\$ 832.57	\$ 4,162.85	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -
III	19	Music	1	Rug, musical notes	Wenger 180A001	Wenger 180A001	\$ 702.10	\$ 702.10	Wenger 180A001	\$ 663.00	\$ 663.00				Wenger180A002	\$ 584.22	\$ 584.22	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -
				GROUP III TOTAL:				\$ 6,404.35			\$ 25,634.00					\$ 5,199.42				\$ -			\$ -		\$ -
IV	20	Pre-K	2	Activity Table, 48" diameter; adj. height, clover or similar shape, rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjust 15 - 24" H; 1 1/8" laminate top	Jonti-Craft 6453JC Elem	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6453JC	\$ 174.00	\$ 348.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 173.13	\$ 346.26	Jonti-Craft 6453JC Elem	\$ 164.99	\$ 329.98	LAKESHORE CN314BU	\$ 222.27	\$ 444.54	Classroom Select #1334861	\$ 135.48	\$ 270.96	NO BID	\$ -
IV	21	Pre-K	2	Activity Table, 60" diameter top; adj. height, flower or similar shape, rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjust 15 - 24" H; 1 1/8" laminate top.	Jonti-Craft 6458JC Elem	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6458JC	\$ 258.00	\$ 516.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 248.99	\$ 497.98	Jonti-Craft 6458JC Elem	\$ 231.36	\$ 462.72	NO BID		\$ -	Classroom Select #1334866	\$ 219.50	\$ 439.00	NO BID	\$ -
IV	22	Pre-K	2	Activity Table, 48" diameter; adj. height, octagon shape, rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjust 15 - 24" H; 1 1/8" laminate top	Jonti-Craft 6428JC Elem	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6428JC	\$ 173.00	\$ 346.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 173.23	\$ 346.46	Jonti-Craft 6428JC Elem	\$ 165.43	\$ 330.86	LAKESHORE CN314BU	\$ 222.27	\$ 444.54	Classroom Select #1334862-Round	\$ 140.18	\$ 280.36	NO BID	\$ -
IV	23	Pre-K, K, 1st and SWD	10	Activity Table, 48 X 72"; adj. height, kidney or similar shape, rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjust 15 - 24" H, 1 1/8" laminate top.	Jonti-Craft 6423JC Elem	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6423JC	\$ 247.00	\$ 2,470.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 239.02	\$ 2,390.20	Jonti-Craft 6423JC Elem	\$ 223.45	\$ 2,234.50	LAKESHORE CN324BU	\$ 296.67	\$ 2,966.70	Classroom Select #1334865	\$ 201.19	\$ 2,011.90	NO BID	\$ -
IV	24	Pre-K	2	Activity Table, adj. height, trapezoid 30 X 60", rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjust 15 - 24" H; 1 1/8" laminate top	Jonti-Craft 6443JC Elem	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6443JC	\$ 267.00	\$ 534.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 165.89	\$ 331.78	Jonti-Craft 6443JC Elem	\$ 159.39	\$ 318.78	LAKESHORE CN342BU	\$ 185.07	\$ 370.14	Classroom Select #1334851	\$ 129.27	\$ 258.54	NO BID	\$ -
IV	25	Pre-K	2	Activity Table, adj. height, circle - round 48", rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjust 15 - 24" H; 1 1/8" laminate top.	Jonti-Craft 6433JC Elem	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6433JC	\$ 174.00	\$ 348.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 173.36	\$ 346.72	Jonti-Craft 6433JC Elem	\$ 165.10	\$ 330.20	LAKESHORE CN314BU	\$ 222.27	\$ 444.54	Classroom Select #1334862	\$ 140.18	\$ 280.36	NO BID	\$ -
IV	26	ineran	2	Activity Table, adj. height, circle - round 48", rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjust 24" H- 31" H; 1 1/8" laminate top.	Jonti-Craft 6433JC (A)	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6433JC (A)	\$ 174.00	\$ 348.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 173.36	\$ 346.72	Jonti-Craft 6433JC (A)	\$ 165.10	\$ 330.20	LAKESHORE 313BU	\$ 222.27	\$ 444.54	Classroom Select #1334862	\$ 140.18	\$ 280.36	NO BID	\$ -

FORM OF PROPOSAL - PART B - Bid 2016-45, Furniture for Jonathan Hager Elementary School

Group No.	Item No.	Room Name	Est. Qty.	Description/Specification	Spec. Make/Model	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price		
IV	27	Grades K & 1	18	Activity Table, adj. height, 30 x 60" rectangle, rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjust 15 - 24" H; 1 1/8" laminate top.	Jonti-Craft 6408JC Elem	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6408JC	\$ 168.00	\$ 3,024.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 167.04	\$ 3,006.72	Jonti-Craft 6408JC Elem	\$ 160.03	\$ 2,880.54	LAKESHORE CN342BU	\$ 185.07	\$ 3,331.26	Classroom Select #1334853	\$ 142.10	\$ 2,557.80	NO BID	\$ -
IV	28	Grades K & 1	18	Activity Table, adj. height, square - 48 X 48"; rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjust 15 - 24" H; 1 1/8" laminate top.	Jonti-Craft 6418JC Elem	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6418JC	\$ 166.00	\$ 2,988.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 165.29	\$ 2,975.22	Jonti-Craft 6418JC Elem	\$ 158.84	\$ 2,859.12	LAKESHORE CN352BU	\$ 157.17	\$ 2,829.06	Classroom Select #1334863	\$ 147.98	\$ 2,663.64	NO BID	\$ -
IV	29	Grd 2 - 5 & SWD	14	Activity Table, adj. height; for reading, crescent or kidney shape; 48" W X 72" L X 24 to 31" H ; 1 1/8" laminate top	Jonti-Craft 6423JC - (A)	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6423JC - (A)	\$ 247.00	\$ 3,458.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 239.02	\$ 3,346.28	Jonti-Craft 6423JC - (A)	\$ 258.88	\$ 3,624.32	LAKESHORE CN323BU	\$ 293.67	\$ 4,111.38	Classroom Select #1334865	\$ 201.19	\$ 2,816.66	NO BID	\$ -
IV	30	SWD 121	1	Activity Table, adj. height, rect. 30 X 48"; rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjust 15 - 24" H; 1 1/8" laminate top.	Jonti-Craft 6473JC	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6473JC	\$ 138.00	\$ 138.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 142.10	\$ 142.10	Jonti-Craft 6473JC	\$ 173.05	\$ 173.05	LAKESHORE CN334BU	\$ 166.47	\$ 166.47	Classroom Select #1334852	\$ 117.11	\$ 117.11	NO BID	\$ -
IV	31	SWD 212	3	Activity Table, adj. height, rect. 30 X 48"; rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjusts 24" H- 31" H; 1 1/8" laminate top.	Jonti-Craft 6473JC (A)	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6473JC (A)	\$ 138.00	\$ 414.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 142.10	\$ 426.30	Jonti-Craft 6473JC (A)	\$ 206.90	\$ 620.70	LAKESHORE CN333BU	\$ 166.47	\$ 499.41	Classroom Select #1334852	\$ 117.11	\$ 351.33	NO BID	\$ -
IV	32	SWD 121	1	Activity table, adj. height, rect. 30" X 72"; rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjusts 15" H - 24" H; 1 1/8" laminate top.	Jonti-Craft 6413JC Elem	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6413JC Elem	\$ 180.00	\$ 180.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 179.94	\$ 179.94	Jonti-Craft 6413JC Elem	\$ 206.90	\$ 206.90	LAKESHORE CN344BU	\$ 212.97	\$ 212.97	Classroom Select #1334854	\$ 158.23	\$ 158.23	NO BID	\$ -
IV	33	SWD 212	2	Activity table, adj. height, rect. 30" X 72"; rainbow color options on edge and legs, adjusts 24" H - 31" H; 1 1/8" laminate top.	Jonti-Craft 6413JC (A)	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft 6413JC (A)	\$ 180.00	\$ 360.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 179.94	\$ 359.88	Jonti-Craft 6413JC (A)	\$ 206.90	\$ 413.80	LAKESHORE CN343BU	\$ 212.97	\$ 425.94	Classroom Select #1334854	\$ 158.23	\$ 316.46	NO BID	\$ -
IV	34	Collaboration K-1 (3 Rms)	3	Stool, cushion seat, swivel casters; removable write-n wipe board; 15"w X 18 1/2" D X 18" H	Jonti-Craft Sidekick	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Jonti-Craft Sidekick	\$ 166.00	\$ 498.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 164.75	\$ 494.25	Jonti-Craft Sidekick	\$ 194.81	\$ 584.43	NO BID	\$ -	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 147.41	\$ 442.23	NO BID	\$ -	
GROUP IV TOTAL:								\$ 15,970.00			\$ 15,536.81			\$ 15,700.10			\$ 42,985.49		\$ 13,244.94		\$ -				
V	35	Café	7	Cafeteria table, 12 ft X 30" wide - Qty. 3 at 29" H and Qty. 4 at 27" H; easy folding; seats 16 students; rectangular with bench seats	Sico or Palmer Hamilton	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Palmer Hamilton #19F62_3012	\$ 1,177.00	\$ 8,239.00		\$ -		Palmer Hamilton	\$ 1,236.51	\$ 8,655.57	NO BID	\$ -	Classroom Select #1433670	\$ 1,023.56	\$ 7,164.92	NO BID	\$ -	
V	36	Café	5	Cafeteria table, round /oval shape w/bench seats, seats 10 students, folds easily; Qty. 3 at 27" H & Qty. 2 at 29"H.	Sico or Palmer Hamilton	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Palmer Hamilton #59T122_60 RD-B4	\$ 1,288.00	\$ 6,440.00		\$ -		Palmer Hamilton	\$ 1,360.13	\$ 6,800.65	NO BID	\$ -	Classroom Select #1441009	\$ 1,168.80	\$ 5,844.00	NO BID	\$ -	

FORM OF PROPOSAL - PART B - Bid 2016-45, Furniture for Jonathan Hager Elementary School

Group No.	Item No.	Room Name	Est. Qty.	Description/Specification	Spec. Make/Model	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price		
V	37	Café	4	Cafeteria table, 12 ft X 30" wide, Qty. 2 at 29" H and qty. 2 at 27"H; easy folding; seats 12 students; rectangular with round poly seats	Sico or Palmer Hamilton	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Palmer Hamilton #60T112_30 13-S12	\$ 1,202.00	\$ 4,808.00			Palmer Hamilton	\$ 1,266.67	\$ 5,066.68	NO BID			Classroom Select #1433632	\$ 1,032.11	\$ 4,128.44	NO BID	\$ -	
V	38	Café	5	Cafeteria table, round/oval shape w/round poly stools; seats 8 students; qty. 3 at 27" H and qty. 2 @ 29"H.	Sico or Palmer Hamilton	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Palmer Hamilton #59T122_60 RD-S8	\$ 1,098.00	\$ 5,490.00			Palmer Hamilton	\$ 1,170.74	\$ 5,853.70	NO BID			Classroom Select #1440993	\$ 906.15	\$ 4,530.75	NO BID	\$ -	
				GROUP V TOTAL:				\$ -			\$ 24,977.00					\$ 26,376.60						\$ 21,668.11		\$ -	
VI	39	K, 2 (2) and SWD	6	Rug, 9 X 12 ft., seats 30 students, color blocks or circles	Lakeshore LA952	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Lakeshore LA952	\$ 695.00	\$ 4,170.00			Lakeshore PP309	\$ 587.51	\$ 3,525.06	LAKESHORE PP309	\$ 445.47	\$ 2,672.82	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	
VI	70	2nd	1	Rug, 9 X 12 ft., Theme: Learning Shapes and Colors	Lakeshore LL802	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Lakeshore LL802	\$ 695.00	\$ 695.00			Lakeshore LL802	\$ 593.87	\$ 593.87			\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	
VI	41	3rd, 4th and 5th & SWD	10	Rug, solid for classrooms, 9 X 12 ft. - 4 navy; 4 forest green; 3 plum.	Lakeshore LC160 (navy); LC110 (forest green); LC150 (plum)	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Lakeshore LC160 (navy);	\$ 640.00	\$ 6,400.00			Lakeshore LC160 (navy); LC110 (forest green); LC150 (plum)	\$ 494.97	\$ 4,949.70	LAKESHORE LC160	\$ 361.77	\$ 3,617.70	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	
VI	40	Pre-K	2	Rug, 9 x 12 ft., theme: Getting Ready to Read	Lakeshore GG288	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Lakeshore GG288	\$ 695.00	\$ 1,390.00			Lakeshore GG288	\$ 593.87	\$ 1,187.74	LAKESHORE GG288	\$ 445.47	\$ 890.94	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	
VI	71	K (2)	2	Rug, 9 x 12 ft., theme: Numbers and Letters Activity	Lakeshore DD497	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Lakeshore DD497	\$ 695.00	\$ 1,390.00			Lakeshore DD497	\$ 593.87	\$ 1,187.74			\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	
VI	72	Pre-K, K (1), 1st	6	Rug, 9 X 12 ft. theme: Alphabet activity	Lakeshore TT669	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Lakeshore TT669	\$ 695.00	\$ 4,170.00			Lakeshore TT669	\$ 593.87	\$ 3,563.22			\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	
				GROUP VI TOTAL:				\$ -			\$ 18,215.00					\$ 15,007.33						\$ -	\$ -		
VII	42	Collaboration K-1 (3 Rms)	3	Table, square; 5/8" thick thermal-fused laminate; 3 mm-thick thermal-fused edge banding; dowel pin construction; round edges - 12"H X 31 3/4"W X 31 3/4"D square.	Demco #P122-2991	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Demco #P122-2991	\$ 227.00	\$ 681.00	Jonticraft 55812JC	\$ 179.34	\$ 538.02	Demco #P122-2991	\$ 185.78	\$ 557.34	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -
VII	43	Collaboration K-1 (3 Rms)	3	Table, round; 5/8" thick thermal-fused laminate; 3 mm-thick thermal-fused edge banding; dowel pin construction; round edges - 12"H X 31 3/4" diameter.	Demco #P122-2990	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Demco #P122-2990	\$ 227.00	\$ 681.00	Jonticraft 56712JC	\$ 139.93	\$ 419.79	Discountinued	\$ -	\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -
VII	44	Collaboration K-1 (3 Rms)	3	Storage, mobile single sided cubbie; 37 X 39 X 27"; 5/8"-thick thermo-fused laminate; 3mm-thick thermo-fused edgebanding; dowel pin construction; All edges are fully rounded; 2" dia. twin wheel casters	Demco #WC12230060	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Demco #WC12230060	\$ 722.00	\$ 2,166.00			Demco #WC12230061	\$ 506.75	\$ 1,520.25	LAKESHORE JJ969 40X18DX32 H	\$ 464.07	\$ 1,392.21	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	
VII	45	Collaboration K-1 (3 Rms)	30	Floor cushion/pillow, 15" round X 3" deep; polyurethane foam core, variety of colors; wipes clean	Demco P135-8450	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Demco P135-8450	\$ 41.00	\$ 1,230.00			Demco P135-8451	\$ 45.12	\$ 1,353.60	LAKESHORE DD370X SET OF 6	\$ 51.15	\$ 1,534.50	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	

FORM OF PROPOSAL - PART B - Bid 2016-45, Furniture for Jonathan Hager Elementary School

Group No.	Item No.	Room Name	Est. Qty.	Description/Specification	Spec. Make/Model	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price		
VII	46	Collaboration K-1 (3 Rms)	6	Chair, lightweight floor rocker; solid wood frame; foam padding; vinyl upholstery; 33" H X 18" W X 24" D	Demco P149-9061	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Demco P149-9061	\$ 188.00	\$ 1,128.00			Demco P149-9062	\$ 137.43	\$ 824.58	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	
VII	47	Collaboration K-1 (3 Rms)	3	Area rug, oval; blue- 10"9" X 7'8"	Demco P153-1288- Joyful faces	?	\$ -	\$ -	Demco P153-1288- Joyful faces	\$ 513.00	\$ 1,539.00			Demco P153-1288- Joyful faces	\$ 383.58	\$ 1,150.74	LAKESHORE PP948 9 X 12 FT		\$ 445.47	\$ 1,336.41	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -
VII	48	SWD 121	2	Bean bag chair; durable vinyl with double-stitched seams; double safety locking zipper; 35" diameter	Demco Cuddle-ups Round Bean Bag	?	\$ -	\$ -	Demco Cuddle-ups Round Bean Bag	\$ 113.00	\$ 226.00			Demco Cuddle-ups Round Bean Bag	\$ 96.99	\$ 193.98	LAKESHORE CK30BU		\$ 65.09	\$ 130.18	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -
VII	49	Collaboration 2-5 (5 Rms)	5	Rug, modern, fun design, 7'8" X 5'4" for seating area	Demco P1356-5826	?	\$ -	\$ -	Demco P1356-5826	\$ 282.00	\$ 1,410.00			Demco P1356-5827	\$ 220.96	\$ 1,104.80	LAKESHORE LL801 6 X 9 FT		\$ 268.77	\$ 1,343.85	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -
				GROUP VI TOTAL:			\$ -	\$ -		\$ -	\$ 9,061.00			\$ 957.81		\$ 6,705.29			\$ 12,918.61		\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	
VIII	50	Collaboration 2-5 (5 Rms)	5	Teaming table; 4-leg 42"D; with glides and power, natural maple top and aluminum base. Mount recommended for up to 42" diagonal flat panel monitor, maximum of 40 lbs., to enable sharing of data and information from a mobile device with up to five people. Monitor features left and right as well as up and down swivel positioning. Work surface includes a Fluid Up power unit to provide easy power above the work surface to laptop, tablets, smart phones, and other devices. Lower cord management bin may be equipped with a power strip or Fluid Down power unit. 60 x 42 x 22 - 32" H.	Bretford Explore EDUSXTM60	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Bretford Explore EDUSXTM60 (electric can be included gbut is not part of this model # or price)	\$ 904.00	\$ 4,520.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 859.12	\$ 4,295.60	Steelcase Collaboration Series BFTP48, BNPL4, CF2500, CFSPC	\$ 731.79	\$ 3,658.95	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -
VIII	51	Collaboration 2-5 (5 Rms)	10	Lounge chair, soft seat, armless, front casters, 23"W x 32" D X 34" H; grade 3 fabric.	Bretford EDUMB600	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Bretford EDUMB600	\$ 630.00	\$ 6,300.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 604.92	\$ 6,049.20	Steelcase Jenny TS31401C	\$ 619.50	\$ 6,195.00	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -
VIII	52	Collaboration 2-5 (5 Rms)	5	Lounge chair, soft seat, armless, w/tablet right and power right; 27"W x 32" D X 34" H; grade 3 fabric.	Bretford EDUMS300TR PR	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Bretford EDUMS300 TRPR	\$ 922.00	\$ 4,610.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 875.05	\$ 4,375.25	Steelcase Jenny TS31401T	\$ 734.50	\$ 3,672.50	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID		\$ -	NO BID	\$ -

FORM OF PROPOSAL - PART B - Bid 2016-45, Furniture for Jonathan Hager Elementary School

Group No.	Item No.	Room Name	Est. Qty.	Description/Specification	Spec. Make/Model	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price
VIII	53	Collaboration 2 - 5 (5 Rms)	5	Lounge chair, soft seat, armless, w/tablet left and power left; 27"W x 32" D X 34" H; grade 3 fabric.	Bretford EDUMS300TL PL	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Bretford EDUMS300 TLPL	\$ 922.00	\$ 4,610.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 875.05	\$ 4,375.25	Steelcase Jenny TS31401T	\$ 772.50	\$ 3,862.50	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
VIII	54	Collaboration 2 - 5 (5 Rms)	5	Table, occasional; laminate top; 20" W X 20" D X 16" H; 4 leg construction; legs are steel tubing.	Bretford EDUMT2020	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Bretford EDUMT2020	\$ 183.00	\$ 915.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 176.83	\$ 884.15	HON Flock HFTLS24	\$ 314.54	\$ 1,572.70	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
				GROUP VIII TOTAL:			\$ -	\$ 20,955.00		\$ -	\$ -		\$ -	\$ -		\$ 18,961.65	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	
IX	55	Pre-K	4	Rocking chair, child's, maple wood; dowel joints; 10" seat height x 29" H X 23" D overall.	Wood Designs 89010	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Wood Designs 89010	\$ 96.00	\$ 384.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 87.35	\$ 349.40	Wood Designs 89010	\$ 127.42	\$ 509.68	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
IX	56	storage	2	Steel bookcases, 35 W x 14" D X 66" H, with 5 shelves.	Uline H-2927	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Uline H-2927	\$ -	\$ -	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 278.54	\$ 557.08	HON Brigade HS72ABC	\$ 217.68	\$ 435.36	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
IX	57	storage	26	Shelving, boltless - assemble with mallet; shelves snap into place and adjust in 1 1/2" increments; 14 g. powder-coated steel with 5/8" particle board shelves; 36 X 18 X 84" H; 5 shelves/unit; 400 lb. shelf capacity.	Uline H-5186	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Uline H-5186	\$ -	\$ -	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 129.41	\$ 3,364.66		\$ 174.73	\$ 4,542.98	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
IX	58	Rm. 180 Gym Storage	6	Shelving, boltless - assemble with mallet; shelves snap into place and adjust in 1 1/2" increments; 14 g. powder-coated steel with 5/8" particle board shelves; 36 X 24 X 84" H; 5 shelves/unit; 400 lb. shelf capacity.	Uline H-5187	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Uline H-5187	\$ -	\$ -	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 156.53	\$ 939.18		\$ 185.71	\$ 1,114.26	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
IX	59	Stage	1	Lectern, portable on casters, oak or maple finish.	Balt 27510	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Balt 27510	\$ 388.00	\$ 388.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 198.04	\$ 198.04	Balt 27511	\$ 301.45	\$ 301.45	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
IX	60	classroom	22	Whiteboard, portable, two sided, reading and writing learning center.	Copernicus RC005	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Copernicus RC005	\$ 325.00	\$ 7,150.00		\$ -	\$ -	Steelcase Groupwork Mobile Easel	\$ 530.16	\$ 11,663.52	LAKESHORE LM902	\$ 278.07	\$ 6,117.54	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -
IX	61	Art	32	Stool, adj. height from 19 - 27"H; steel with padded seat.	National Public Seating	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	NPS # 6418H	\$ 33.20	\$ 1,062.40	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 39.23	\$ 1,255.36	Steelcase Verge Stool	\$ 251.34	\$ 8,042.88	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
IX	62	Art	8	Art table, 48 X 48"; maple top, 30" H; adjustable floor glides; 13 g. braces.	Shain #HN-DWC006	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Diversified # WX4-M	\$ 907.00	\$ 7,256.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 823.23	\$ 6,585.84		\$ 1,207.44	\$ 9,659.52	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
IX	63	PTA & Teacher Workrm	2	Work/utility Table, 30 X 72", 29"H	Hon UTM3072	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Hon UTM3072	\$ 224.00	\$ 448.00		\$ -	\$ -		\$ 250.25	\$ 500.50	LAKESHORE CN453	\$ 212.97	\$ 425.94	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -

FORM OF PROPOSAL - PART B - Bid 2016-45, Furniture for Jonathan Hager Elementary School

Group No.	Item No.	Room Name	Est. Qty.	Description/Specification	Spec. Make/Model	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bid Make/Model	Unit Price	Extended Price
IX	64	Collaboration Grades 2-3	12	Stool, 15" ; ergonomic; polypropylene body; allows for movement while sitting; stable and safe for children.	VS America, Inc. #03825 - 15" seat	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	VS America, Inc. #03825 - 15" seat	\$ 81.00	\$ 972.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 80.61	\$ 967.32	No Bid	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -
IX	65	Collaboration 4-5	18	Stool, 18"; ergonomic; polypropylene body; allows for movement while sitting; stable and safe for children.	VS America, Inc. #03825 - 18 1/8" seat	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	VS America, Inc. #03825 - 18 1/8" seat	\$ 91.00	\$ 1,638.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 88.32	\$ 1,589.76	No Bid	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -
IX	66	Pre-K, K, 1st and SWDs	11	Rocking chair, adult, maple wood; seat height 16 - 21"W X 43" H X 24" D	Whitney Bros. 5536	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Whitney Bros. 5536	\$ 248.00	\$ 2,728.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 222.21	\$ 2,444.31		\$ 317.53	\$ 3,492.83	LAKESHORE GR290	\$ 417.57	\$ 4,593.27	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -
IX	67	Various	42	File cabinet, metal, vertical, 4-dr.	Hon 214P	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Hon 214P	\$ 314.00	\$ 13,188.00		\$ -	\$ -		\$ 358.29	\$ 15,048.18	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	
IX	68	Pre-K	2	Storage, folding, maple 36" H, two units hinged together with locking clasp.	Wood Designs 13720	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Wood Designs 13720	\$ 1,115.00	\$ 2,230.00	AS SPECIFIED	\$ 909.73	\$ 1,819.46		\$ 725.26	\$ 1,450.52	LAKESHORE DG237	\$ 631.47	\$ 1,262.94	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -
IX	73	Records	3	File cabinet, metal, 5 dr. lateral, 42" W X 19 1/4" D X 67" H	Hon H895	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Hon H895	\$ 845.00	\$ 2,535.00		\$ -	\$ -		\$ 860.57	\$ 2,581.71	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	
IX	69	Center for Ed Services	25	Chair, upholstered seat and back, folds for standing storage, casters, nesting- must match existing chairs at WCBOE Auditorium - grade III AI Attire Seating 10 Onyx; chairs have silver painted tubular legs; install at 10435 Downsville Pike, Hagerstown, MD 21740	Hon Perpetual #HPN1.A.UU.A I10.T1	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	Hon Perpetual #HPN1.A.UU.A I10.T1	\$ 226.00	\$ 5,650.00		\$ -	\$ -		\$ 860.57	\$ 21,514.25	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	
				GROUP IX TOTAL:				\$ 45,629.40			\$ 40,049.86			\$ 80,857.64			\$ 12,399.69						
				TOTAL:				\$ 238,678.50			\$ 156,150.18			\$ 322,829.19			\$ 55,904.10			\$ 45,444.47			\$ 140,129.50
				TOTAL:														\$ -					\$ -

\*Item # 50  
Option with stand alone fluid power up 9 ft.  
Bretford:  
EDUSDPT60

\*70 CES  
HON  
Perpetual  
#HPN1.A.UU.A  
U.A.I10.n