

Bid 2024-53 School Bus and Vehicle Tire Bid Tabulation

Tires

Published Price Schedule	McCarthy Tire Service		Donald B Rice Tire Company	
	Goodyear Tires Plus (+) Percent (%) Markup	Goodyear Tires Minus (-) Percent (%) Discount	Goodyear Tires Plus (+) Percent (%) Markup	Goodyear Tires Minus (-) Percent (%) Discount
1 Manufacturer's School Bus and Passenger Tires Program*	No Bid	No Bid	0%	-2%
2 Maryland State Contract Tire Pricing*	No Bid	No Bid	0%	-2%

Published Price Schedule	Michelin Tires Plus (+) Percent (%) Markup	Michelin Tires Minus (-) Percent (%) Discount	Michelin Tires Plus (+) Percent (%) Markup	Michelin Tires Minus (-) Percent (%) Discount
	1 Manufacturer's School Bus and Passenger Tires Program*	No Bid	No Bid	0%
2 Maryland State Contract Tire Pricing*	No Bid	No Bid	0%	-2%

McCarthy Tire Service

Service	Unit of Measure	Passenger Automobile		
		Bus	Light Truck	Passenger Automobile
1 Shop Labor Rate (steering, suspension, brake work, DOT inspections, etc.)	Per Hour	\$ 115.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 115.00
2 Service call	Per Call	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00
3 Dismount tire	Per Tire	\$ 32.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 15.00
4 4-wheel alignment	Per Alignment	\$ 145.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00
5 Tire install w/in store purchase including the dismount of used tire	Per Tire	\$ 32.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 15.00
6 Flat repair, on vehicle (remove/repair/mount)	Per Tire	\$ 60.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00
7 Flat repair, off vehicle (repair/mount)	Per Tire	\$ 45.00	\$ 22.50	\$ 22.50
8 Rotate mounted tire	Per Tire	\$ 20.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 10.00
9 New valve stem rubber	Per Tire	N/A	\$ 4.50	\$ 3.50
10 New valve stem metal	Per Tire	\$ 7.50	\$ 6.00	N/A
11 Wheel balance-computer spin and balance	Per Tire	\$ 35.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00
12 Used tire recycle/disposal fee	Per Tire	\$ 19.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 5.00
13 Power coat rims	Per Rim	\$ 38.50	\$ 38.50	\$ 38.50

Donald B Rice Tire Company

Service	Unit of Measure	Passenger Automobile		
		Bus	Light Truck	Passenger Automobile
1 Shop Labor Rate (steering, suspension, brake work, DOT inspections, etc.)	Per Hour	\$ 79.99	\$ 79.99	\$ 79.99
2 Service call	Per Call	\$ 91.00	\$ 91.00	\$ 91.00
3 Dismount tire	Per Tire	\$ 25.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 5.00
4 4-wheel alignment	Per Alignment	\$ 125.00	\$ 69.99	\$ 69.99
5 Tire install w/in store purchase including the dismount of used tire	Per Tire	\$ 25.00	Included	Included
6 Flat repair, on vehicle (remove/repair/mount)	Per Tire	\$ 32.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 15.00
7 Flat repair, off vehicle (repair/mount)	Per Tire	\$ 32.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 15.00
8 Rotate mounted tire	Per Tire	\$ 10.00	Included	Included
9 New valve stem rubber	Per Tire	N/A	\$ 2.00	\$ 2.00
10 New valve stem metal	Per Tire	\$ 5.00	\$ 5.00	N/A
11 Wheel balance-computer spin and balance	Per Tire	\$ 20.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00
12 Used tire recycle/disposal fee	Per Tire	\$ 12.00	\$ 6.00	\$ 4.00
13 Power coat rims	Per Rim	\$ 27.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 18.00