

2020-20

Mechanical and Refrigeration Maintenance for the Food Service Department
Tabulation

	Technical Score (Max Score 60)	Cost Score (Max Score 40)	Total Score (Max Score 100)
My Three Sons (MTS)	52.67	40.00	92.67
Ty Construction Company, Inc.	54.33	40.00	94.33

Service Description	My Three Sons (MTS)	Ty Construction Company, Inc.	
Refrigeration Equipment – Maintenance and Repair Services Contract	No Bid	\$ 5,000.00	Per Month
	No Bid	\$ 60,000.00	Per Year
Mechanical Equipment – Maintenance and Repair Services Contract	\$ 2,994.00	No Bid	Per Month
	\$ 35,928.00	No Bid	Per Year

Parts (Not Covered in Scope of Services/Specification)

Mark up over Awarded Bidder's parts cost for part under \$1,000	20%	15%
Mark up over Awarded Bidder's parts cost for parts costing \$1,000 or more	15%	10%

Emergency/After Hours Labor Rates

Certified Technician	\$ 135.00	\$ 120.00	Per Hour
Non-Certified Technician	\$ 90.00	No Bid	Per Hour

Refrigerant Prices

R404A refrigerant	No Bid	\$ 4.75	Per Pound
R414B refrigerant	No Bid	\$ 21.69	Per Pound
R22 refrigerant	No Bid	\$ 13.50	Per Pound
R134 refrigerant	No Bid	\$ 4.00	Per Pound
R290 Hydrocarbon	No Bid	\$ 18.95	Per Pound
R401 refrigerant A	No Bid	\$ 19.25	Per Pound
R401 refrigerant B	No Bid	\$ 17.00	Per Pound
R409A refrigerant	No Bid	\$ 18.25	Per Pound
R502 refrigerant	No Bid	\$ 19.99	Per Pound