

Exhibit 8

**Bid 2024-35
Landscaping Materials
Bid Tab**

			Gold Leaf Group, Inc.	Gold Leaf Group, Inc.	Gold Leaf Group, Inc.	Metro Recreation, Inc.	Metro Recreation, Inc.	Metro Recreation, Inc.	Northwest Recycling	Northwest Recycling	Northwest Recycling	Siteone Landscape Supply	Siteone Landscape Supply	Siteone Landscape Supply	The Mulch Man, LLC	The Mulch Man, LLC	The Mulch Man, LLC
Item	Product Description	Quantity	Price per Cubic Yard Delivered	Price per Cubic Yard Picked-Up	Price per Cubic Yard Delivered and Spread	Price per Cubic Yard Delivered	Price per Cubic Yard Picked-Up	Price per Cubic Yard Delivered and Spread	Price per Cubic Yard Delivered	Price per Cubic Yard Picked-Up	Price per Cubic Yard Delivered and Spread	Price per Cubic Yard Delivered	Price per Cubic Yard Picked-Up	Price per Cubic Yard Delivered and Spread	Price per Cubic Yard Delivered	Price per Cubic Yard Picked-Up	Price per Cubic Yard Delivered and Spread
1	Bulk Landscape Mulch	1-10 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 53.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 35.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 59.00
		11-20 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 52.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 35.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 59.00
		21-50 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 51.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 34.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 58.00
		51 and Greater Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 50.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	Non-Responsive	Non-Responsive	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 27.69	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 33.00	\$ 26.00
2	Bulk Landscape Mulch Dyed (Black, Red, Etc.)	1-10 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 57.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 40.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 64.00
		11-20 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 56.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 40.00	\$ 34.00	\$ 64.00
		21-50 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 55.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 39.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 63.00
		51 and Greater Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 54.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ 32.31	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 38.00	\$ 32.00
3	Playground Engineered Wood Fiber	1-10 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 55.00	\$ 33.00	\$ -	\$ 65.00			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 38.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 62.00
		11-20 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 54.00	\$ 33.00	\$ -	\$ 65.00			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 38.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 62.00
		21-50 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 53.00	\$ 33.00	\$ -	\$ 65.00			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 37.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 61.00
		51 and Greater Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 52.00	\$ 33.00	\$ -	\$ 65.00			\$ -	\$ -	\$ 43.08	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 36.00	\$ 32.00
4	Tan Maryland River Rock Random Size Between 3/4" - 1-1/2"	1-10 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 84.00	\$ 79.00	\$ 104.00
		11-20 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 84.00	\$ 79.00	\$ 104.00
		21-50 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 83.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 102.00
		51 and Greater Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 83.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 102.00
5	Tan Maryland River Rock Random Size Between 1-1/2" - 2-1/2"	1-10 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 93.00	\$ 88.00	\$ 113.00
		11-20 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 93.00	\$ 88.00	\$ 113.00
		21-50 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 92.00	\$ 86.00	\$ 111.00
		51 and Greater Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 92.00	\$ 86.00	\$ 111.00
5	Red Tipple Stone Size 3/4"	1-10 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 95.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 110.00
		11-20 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 95.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 110.00
		21-50 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 94.00	\$ 89.00	\$ 108.00
		51 and Greater Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 93.00	\$ 88.00	\$ 108.00
6	Sifted Top Soil	1-10 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 71.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 43.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 63.00
		11-20 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 70.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 43.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 63.00
		21-50 Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 69.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 42.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 61.00
		51 and Greater Cubic Yards	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 68.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 42.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 60.00
7	Description	Price Per Foot (Installed)			Price Per Foot (Installed)			Price Per Foot (Installed)			Price Per Foot (Installed)			Price Per Foot (Installed)			
	Metal Painted Finish 4" to 6" height Landscape Edging	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			8.00			
8	Description	Hourly Labor Rate per Person			Hourly Labor Rate per Person			Hourly Labor Rate per Person			Hourly Labor Rate per Person			Hourly Labor Rate per Person			
	Debris Removal, Area Preparation and General Landscaping	50.00			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			30.00			