

Exhibit 15

Bid 2018-45
Flooring
Lump Sum School Projects - Price Proposal Form

	Carpet Gallery	Dorsey Brothers
Clear Spring High School	No Bid	No Bid
Fountain Rock Elementary School	\$ 64,550.00	\$ 83,455.00

**Bid 2018-45
Flooring
Unit Price - Bid Tab**

Removal and Repair		Carpet Gallery		Dorsey Brothers	
Description	UOM	Unit Price Non-Standard		Unit Price Non-Standard	
		Unit Price Standard Hours M-F 8:00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.	Hours Weekends/Holiday's and M-F After 5:00 P.M.	Unit Price Standard Hours M-F 8:00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.	Hours Weekends/Holiday's and M-F After 5:00 P.M.
1 Seam Repair	Linear Foot	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 47.00
2 Re-glue Carpet	Square yard	\$ 7.50	\$ 9.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 16.50
3 Remove Existing Carpet - Non Powerbond RS	Square yard	\$ 2.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 4.00	\$ 5.40
4 Remove Existing Carpet - Powerbond RS	Square yard	\$ 4.00	\$ 5.50	\$ 6.00	\$ 8.00
5 Floor Prep - Patch and Prep to Accept Carpet	Square yard	\$ 3.15	\$ 4.00	\$ 9.90	\$ 12.90
Carpet		Unit Price Non-Standard		Unit Price Non-Standard	
Description	UOM	Unit Price Non-Standard		Unit Price Non-Standard	
		Unit Price Standard Hours M-F 8:00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.	Hours Weekends/Holiday's and M-F After 5:00 P.M.	Unit Price Standard Hours M-F 8:00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.	Hours Weekends/Holiday's and M-F After 5:00 P.M.
1 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 1 0-100	Square yard	\$ 28.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 36.50	\$ 39.50
2 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 1 101-500	Square yard	\$ 28.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 36.50	\$ 39.50
3 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 1 501-1000	Square yard	\$ 26.50	\$ 28.00	\$ 36.50	\$ 39.50
4 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 1 1001 plus	Square yard	\$ 26.50	\$ 28.00	\$ 36.50	\$ 39.50
5 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 2 0-100	Square yard	\$ 28.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 36.50	\$ 39.50
6 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 2 101-500	Square yard	\$ 28.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 36.50	\$ 39.50
7 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 2 501-1000	Square yard	\$ 26.50	\$ 28.00	\$ 36.50	\$ 39.50
8 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 2 1001 plus	Square yard	\$ 26.50	\$ 28.00	\$ 36.50	\$ 39.50
9 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 3 0-100	Square yard	\$ 26.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 25.85	\$ 28.85
10 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 3 101-500	Square yard	\$ 26.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 25.85	\$ 28.85
11 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 3 501-1000	Square yard	\$ 26.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 25.85	\$ 28.85
12 Provide & Install New Carpet Type 3 1001 plus	Square yard	\$ 26.50	\$ 22.50	\$ 25.85	\$ 28.85
17 Install WCPS Furnished Carpet	Square yard	\$ 8.00	\$ 10.00	No Bid	No Bid
Tile		Unit Price Non-Standard		Unit Price Non-Standard	
Description	UOM	Unit Price Non-Standard		Unit Price Non-Standard	
		Unit Price Standard Hours M-F 8:00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.	Hours Weekends/Holiday's and M-F After 5:00 P.M.	Unit Price Standard Hours M-F 8:00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.	Hours Weekends/Holiday's and M-F After 5:00 P.M.
1 Remove Existing Floor Tile	Square foot	\$ 0.50	\$ 0.60	\$ 0.50	\$ 0.68
2 Floor Prep - Patch and Prep to Accept VCT	Square foot	\$ 0.50	\$ 0.60	\$ 1.20	\$ 1.60
3 Provide & Install VCT Floor Tile (Standard Tile 12" x 12")	Square foot	\$ 1.95	\$ 2.15	\$ 2.20	\$ 2.97
4 Provide & Install VCT Floor Tile (Premium Tile 12" x 12")	Square foot	\$ 4.40	\$ 4.60	\$ 3.80	\$ 5.10
5 Provide & Install Porcelain Floor Tile (12" x 12")	Square foot	\$ 9.50	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.00	\$ 13.50
6 Provide & Install Porcelain Floor Tile (12" x 24")	Square foot	\$ 10.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 11.50	\$ 15.00
7 Provide & Install Porcelain Floor Tile (24" x 24")	Square foot	\$ 10.75	\$ 11.75	\$ 12.50	\$ 16.50
8 Provide & Install Glazed Floor Tile (12" x 12")	Square foot	\$ 8.25	\$ 9.25	\$ 9.75	\$ 10.80
9 Provide & Install Glazed Floor Tile (12" x 24")	Square foot	\$ 8.75	\$ 9.75	\$ 10.25	\$ 12.30
10 Provide & Install Glazed Floor Tile (18" x 18")	Square foot	\$ 9.25	\$ 10.25	\$ 10.95	\$ 13.15
11 Provide & Install 2" x 2" Mosaic Floor Tile less than 0.5 %	Square foot	\$ 10.75	\$ 11.75	\$ 10.95	\$ 13.15
12 Provide & Install 3" x 3" Mosaic Floor Tile less than 0.5%	Square foot	\$ 12.25	\$ 13.25	No Bid	No Bid
13 Provide & Install Mosaic 2" x 2" Floor Tile less than 3%	Square foot	\$ 10.75	\$ 11.75	\$ 13.50	\$ 16.20
14 Provide & Install Mosaic 3" x 3" Floor Tile less than 3%	Square foot	\$ 12.25	\$ 13.25	No Bid	No Bid
15 Provide & Install Quarry Floor Tile (Tile 3.875" x 8")	Square foot	\$ 10.35	\$ 11.35	No Bid	No Bid
16 Provide & Install Quarry Floor Tile (Tile 6" x 6")	Square foot	\$ 9.90	\$ 10.90	\$ 12.40	\$ 14.95
17 Provide & Install Quarry Floor Tile (Tile 8" x 8")	Square foot	\$ 10.25	\$ 11.25	\$ 13.65	\$ 16.40

Exhibit 15

Base, Stair Tread, Miscellaneous

Carpet Gallery

Dorsey Brothers

	UOM	Unit Price Non-Standard		Unit Price Non-Standard	
		Unit Price Standard Hours M-F 8:00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.	Hours Weekends/Holiday's and M-F After 5:00 P.M.	Unit Price Standard Hours M-F 8:00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.	Hours Weekends/Holiday's and M-F After 5:00 P.M.
1 Provide & Install Cove Base, All Colors (Vinyl 4")	Linear Foot	\$ 1.70	\$ 1.90	\$ 1.95	\$ 2.55
2 Provide & Install Cover Base, All Colors (Vinyl 6")	Linear Foot	\$ 2.15	\$ 2.35	\$ 2.25	\$ 2.95
3 Provide & Install Cover Base, All Colors (Rubber 4")	Linear Foot	\$ 1.85	\$ 2.05	\$ 2.05	\$ 3.10
4 Provide & Install Cover Base, All Colors (Rubber 6")	Linear Foot	\$ 2.25	\$ 2.45	\$ 3.00	\$ 4.05
5 Provide & Install Stair Tread	Linear Foot	\$ 26.50	\$ 30.00	\$ 26.40	\$ 35.80
7 Under Cut Wood Door	each	\$ 75.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 87.00

Labor and Percentage Mark-ups

	UOM	Unit Price Non-Standard		Unit Price Non-Standard	
		Unit Price Standard Hours M-F 8:00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.	Hours Weekends/Holiday's and M-F After 5:00 P.M.	Unit Price Standard Hours M-F 8:00 A.M. - 5:00 P.M.	Hours Weekends/Holiday's and M-F After 5:00 P.M.
1 Miscellaneous Work, Hourly Charge Per Each Man	Per Hour	\$ 35.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00
2 Percentage of mark-up above cost for rental of equipment to level floors, grind concrete, etc.	Percent	20%	30%	No Bid	No Bid
3 Percentage of mark-up above cost for additional materials not included in above work.	Percent	25%	25%	45%	45%