

Snow Removal / Bid 2017-05 / Bid Tabulation

Areas	Schools	Advantage Landscape & Construction, Inc.				East Coast Landscaping & Excavating				Mann Construction, Inc.			
		1"-6" per removal	6.01"-12" per removal	12.01"-18" per removal	Provision and Spreading of salt/snow melt	1"-6" per removal	6.01"-12" per removal	12.01"-18" per removal	Provision and Spreading of salt/snow melt	1"-6" per removal	6.01"-12" per removal	12.01"-18" per removal	Provision and Spreading of salt/snow melt
Boonsboro Area	Pleasant Valley ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 275.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Sharpsburg ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 275.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Clear Spring Area	Clear Spring Complex (ES, MS, HS)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Hancock Area	Hancock ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 175.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 200.00
	Hancock MS/HS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 200.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 360.00	\$ 200.00
Northern Area	Fountaindale ES	\$ 510.00	\$ 715.00	\$ 1,065.00	No Bid	\$ 300.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Northern MS	\$ 399.00	\$ 572.00	\$ 922.00	No Bid	\$ 375.00	\$ 475.00	\$ 575.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	North Hagerstown HS	\$ 1,026.00	\$ 1,497.00	\$ 1,977.00	No Bid	\$ 850.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 1,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Smithsburg Area	Smithsburg Complex (ES, MS, HS)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Cascade ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Old Forge ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Williamsport Area	Williamsport ES	\$ 506.00	\$ 732.00	\$ 1,022.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Springfield MS	\$ 452.00	\$ 645.00	\$ 945.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Williamsport HS	\$ 548.00	\$ 832.00	\$ 1,217.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Additional services: Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the **Applied Ton:** \$ 295.00 **Additional services:** Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the **Applied Ton:** \$ 175.00 **Additional services:** Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the **Applied Ton:** \$ 200.00

Areas	Schools	Shades of Green Landscaping, LLC				Smithsburg Rentals				Snow and Ice Management Company			
		1"-6" per removal	6.01"-12" per removal	12.01"-18" per removal	Provision and Spreading of salt/snow melt	1"-6" per removal	6.01"-12" per removal	12.01"-18" per removal	Provision and Spreading of salt/snow melt	1"-6" per removal	6.01"-12" per removal	12.01"-18" per removal	Provision and Spreading of salt/snow melt
Boonsboro Area	Pleasant Valley ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 277.00	\$ 515.35	\$ 992.05	\$ 142.00
	Sharpsburg ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 169.00	\$ 346.45	\$ 701.35	\$ 175.00
Clear Spring Area	Clear Spring Complex (ES, MS, HS)	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 9,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 788.00	\$ 1,615.40	\$ 3,270.20	No Bid
Hancock Area	Hancock ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 132.00	\$ 270.60	\$ 547.80	\$ 110.00
	Hancock MS/HS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 288.00	\$ 590.40	\$ 1,195.20	\$ 180.00
Northern Area	Fountaindale ES	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 4,800.00	\$ 6,950.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 292.00	\$ 598.60	\$ 1,211.80	No Bid
	Northern MS	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 4,800.00	\$ 6,950.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 209.00	\$ 428.45	\$ 867.35	No Bid
	North Hagerstown HS	\$ 2,900.00	\$ 7,250.00	\$ 9,950.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 773.00	\$ 1,584.65	\$ 3,207.95	No Bid
Smithsburg Area	Smithsburg Complex (ES, MS, HS)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 900.00	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 3,600.00	No Bid	\$ 845.00	\$ 1,732.25	\$ 3,506.75	No Bid
	Cascade ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 220.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 800.00	No Bid	\$ 131.00	\$ 268.55	\$ 543.65	No Bid
	Old Forge ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 220.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 800.00	No Bid	\$ 199.00	\$ 407.95	\$ 827.65	No Bid
Williamsport Area	Williamsport ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 517.00	\$ 1,059.85	\$ 2,145.55	No Bid
	Springfield MS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 243.00	\$ 498.15	\$ 1,008.45	No Bid
	Williamsport HS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 466.00	\$ 955.00	\$ 1,951.60	No Bid

Additional services: Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the **Applied Ton:** \$ 325.00 **Additional services:** Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the **Applied Ton:** No Bid **Additional services:** Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the **Applied Ton:** \$ 175.00