

**Bid 2019-35**  
**Chevrolet, Nissan, and Non-OEM Parts and Repair Labor**

<b>Auto Electric Inc.</b>	<b>Fitzgerald Auto Mall</b>	<b>Hoffman Automotive</b>
---------------------------	-----------------------------	---------------------------

**OEM Part and Accessories**

- 1 New **OEM** factory replacement parts and accessories for **General Motors** products

	Maximum Percentage Above Vendor Cost	Maximum Percentage Above Vendor Cost	Maximum Percentage Above Vendor Cost
Automotive parts and accessories	30%	20%	30%
Light-duty truck parts and accessories	30%	20%	30%
Medium-duty truck parts and accessories	30%	25%	30%

- 2 New **OEM** factory replacement parts and accessories for **Nissan** products

	Percentage Above Vendor Cost	Percentage Above Vendor Cost	Percentage Above Vendor Cost
Automotive parts and accessories	30%	25%	30%
Light-duty truck parts and accessories	30%	25%	30%
Medium-duty truck parts and accessories	30%	25%	30%

**OEM Equivalent Part and Accessories**

- 3 New aftermarket (**OEM EQUIVALENT**) replacement parts and supplies as listed below

	Percentage Above Vendor Cost	Percentage Above Vendor Cost	Percentage Above Vendor Cost
Automotive parts and accessories	60%	30%	30%
Light-duty truck parts and accessories	60%	30%	30%
Medium-duty truck parts and accessories	60%	30%	30%
Bus parts and accessories	60%	No Bid	30%
Vehicle and Shop Supplies	60%	30%	30%

**Service**

- 1 **OEM** trained and certified technicians for **General Motors** products Service

	Hourly Shop Rate	Hourly Shop Rate	Hourly Shop Rate
Automotive	\$ 79.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 85.00
Light-duty truck/van	\$ 79.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 85.00
Medium-duty truck/van	No Bid	\$ 99.00	\$ 95.00

- 2 OEM trained and certified technicians for **Nissan** Service

	Hourly Shop Rate	Hourly Shop Rate	Hourly Shop Rate
Automotive	\$ 79.00	\$ 99.00	No Bid
Light-duty truck/van	\$ 79.00	\$ 99.00	No Bid
Medium-duty truck/van	No Bid	\$ 99.00	No Bid

- 3 Trained and Certified Technicians for Vehicle Repair Services

	Hourly Shop Rate	Hourly Shop Rate	Hourly Shop Rate
Automotive	\$ 79.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 85.00
Light-duty truck/van	\$ 79.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 85.00
Medium-duty truck/van	No Bid	\$ 99.00	\$ 95.00