

**Bid 2020-09**  
**Unit Price Contract for Cabling Installation, Parts, and Equipment**  
**Bid Tabulation**

**I. Billable Self Performed Labor Trade Rates**

*(The Billable Labor Rates shall include all small tools, taxes, supervision, insurances, overhead, profit, etc.)  
The hourly rates will be the maximum charged during the year.*

		<b>High Performance Cabling</b>	
1	<b>Certified Cable Installer</b>		
	Daytime Rate	\$ 45.00	Per Hour
	Evening Rate	\$ 45.00	Per Hour
	Saturday Rate	\$ 65.00	Per Hour
	Sunday Rate	\$ 65.00	Per Hour
	Federal Holiday Rate	\$ 65.00	Per Hour
2	<b>Laborer</b>		
	Daytime Rate	No Bid	Per Hour
	Evening Rate	No Bid	Per Hour
	Saturday Rate	No Bid	Per Hour
	Sunday Rate	No Bid	Per Hour
	Federal Holiday Rate	No Bid	Per Hour

**II. Unit Prices**

*The Unit Prices will be the maximum charged during the year.*

1	CAT 6 Cable - Plenum	\$ 0.22	Per Foot
2	CAT 6 Cable - Non-Plenum	\$ 0.14	Per Foot
3	Two Conductor 18 ga. Shielded	\$ 0.13	Per Foot
4	24-port Cat 6 Patch Panel (Loaded w/ 24 RJ-45 Connectors)	\$ 185.88	Each
5	48-port Cat 6 Patch Panel (Loaded w/ 48 RJ-45 Connectors)	\$ 349.46	Each
6	Cat 6 RJ-45 Female Connector	\$ 6.21	Each
7	Faceplates	\$ 2.02	Each
8	Patch Cable - 1 foot	\$ 1.15	Each
9	Patch Cable - 3 foot	\$ 1.45	Each
10	Patch Cable - 5 foot	\$ 1.76	Each
11	Patch Cable - 10 foot	\$ 2.59	Each
12	Hangers	\$ 0.93	Each
13	7ft Racks	\$ 180.31	Each
14	Ladder Rack	\$ 7.71	Per Foot
15	Fire Patching	\$ 8.75	Each
16	Horizontal Manager	\$ 40.85	Each
17	Vertical Manager	\$ 134.67	Each
18	Grounding and Bonding Equipment	\$ 15.00	Each

**III. Percentage indicated represents contractor's total margin (profit and overhead) above the cost of materials (including shipping), Sub-Contractor performed work, and/or Rental Equipment**

*This Percentage will be the maximum percentage charged during the life of the contract.*

1	Bogen Materials Mark-up	15%	Percent
2	Miscellaneous Materials Mark-up	15%	Percent
3	Sub-Contractor Mark-up	0%	Percent
4	Rental Equipment Mark-up	0%	Percent

**IV. Hours of Operation (Daytime shift must be at least 8 hours)**

	<b>Start</b>	<b>End</b>
Daytime (Monday - Friday):	6:00 AM	2:30 PM
Evening (Monday - Friday):	2:30 PM	11:00 PM