

2021-11 Snow Removal
Bid Tabulation

Areas	Schools	Advantage Landscape & Construction, Inc.			Smithsburg Rentals & Services, LLC			Potomac Grounds Care, LLC			
		.01"- 6" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	6.01"-12" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	12.01"-18" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	.01"- 6" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	6.01"-12" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	12.01"-18" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	.01"- 6" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	6.01"-12" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	12.01"-18" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	
Boonsboro Area	Pleasant Valley ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 300.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 600.00	
	Sharpsburg ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 300.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 600.00	
Clear Spring Area	Clear Spring Complex (ES, MS, HS)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 800.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,600.00	
Hancock Area	Hancock ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,500.00	
	Hancock MS/HS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,500.00	
Northern Area	Fountaindale ES	\$ 739.00	\$ 929.00	\$ 1,269.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 225.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 450.00	
	Northern MS	\$ 629.00	\$ 799.00	\$ 1,099.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 300.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 600.00	
	North Hagerstown HS	\$ 1,224.00	\$ 1,599.00	\$ 1,999.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 750.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 1,500.00	
Smithsburg Area	Smithsburg Complex (ES, MS, HS)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,550.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 4,250.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 1,800.00	
	Cascade ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 470.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 900.00	
	Old Forge ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 470.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 900.00	
Williamsport Area	Williamsport ES	\$ 755.00	\$ 981.00	\$ 1,271.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 450.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 900.00	
	Springfield MS	\$ 701.00	\$ 894.00	\$ 1,194.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 200.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 900.00	
	Williamsport HS	\$ 797.00	\$ 1,081.00	\$ 1,466.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 450.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 900.00	
Additional services: Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the Applied Ton: \$ 249.00				Additional services: Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the Applied Ton: \$ 350.00				Additional services: Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the Applied Ton: \$ 165.00			

Areas	Schools	Clean Cuts Lawn Care, LLC			East Coast Landscaping & Excavating			Hart's Landscaping & Snow Removal			
		.01"- 6" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	6.01"-12" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	12.01"-18" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	.01"- 6" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	6.01"-12" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	12.01"-18" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	.01"- 6" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	6.01"-12" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	12.01"-18" per removal and The First Application of Salt/Snow Melt	
Boonsboro Area	Pleasant Valley ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$650.00	\$850.00	\$1,500.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 735.00	\$ 945.00	
	Sharpsburg ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$875.00	\$1,075.00	\$3,000.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 735.00	\$ 945.00	
Clear Spring Area	Clear Spring Complex (ES, MS, HS)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,400.00	\$2,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 1,925.00	\$ 2,500.00	
Hancock Area	Hancock ES	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$600.00	\$900.00	\$1,800.00	\$ 525.00	\$ 725.00	\$ 925.00	
	Hancock MS/HS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$750.00	\$1,250.00	\$2,700.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,500.00	
Northern Area	Fountaindale ES	\$ 495.00	\$ 560.00	\$ 610.00	\$475.00	\$575.00	\$1,000.00	\$ 480.00	\$ 665.00	\$ 895.00	
	Northern MS	\$ 455.00	\$ 515.00	\$ 555.00	\$575.00	\$875.00	\$1,000.00	\$ 525.00	\$ 725.00	\$ 950.00	
	North Hagerstown HS	\$ 1,625.00	\$ 1,775.00	\$ 1,905.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,800.00	\$2,800.00	\$ 1,395.00	\$ 1,825.00	\$ 2,425.00	
Smithsburg Area	Smithsburg Complex (ES, MS, HS)	\$ 1,840.00	\$ 2,085.00	\$ 2,270.00	\$2,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$4,150.00	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 1,795.00	\$ 2,395.00	
	Cascade ES	\$ 290.00	\$ 330.00	\$ 360.00	\$575.00	\$875.00	\$1,500.00	\$ 575.00	\$ 795.00	\$ 1,075.00	
	Old Forge ES	\$ 355.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 435.00	\$575.00	\$875.00	\$1,500.00	\$ 525.00	\$ 725.00	\$ 925.00	
Williamsport Area	Williamsport ES	\$ 980.00	\$ 1,110.00	\$ 1,215.00	\$900.00	\$1,400.00	\$2,800.00	\$ 595.00	\$ 840.00	\$ 1,175.00	
	Springfield MS	\$ 530.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 655.00	\$800.00	\$1,300.00	\$2,600.00	\$ 525.00	\$ 735.00	\$ 1,025.00	
	Williamsport HS	\$ 740.00	\$ 835.00	\$ 910.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00	\$2,450.00	\$ 625.00	\$ 975.00	\$ 1,295.00	
Additional services: Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the Applied Ton: \$ 290.00				Additional services: Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the Applied Ton: \$ 165.00				Additional services: Price to Spread Salt/Snow Melt by the Applied Ton: \$ 295.00			