

Exhibit 2

RFP 2018-39
Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers

Company	Total Score (Max Score 100)
Ardor Health Solutions	94.00
Comprehensive Therapy Consultants	90.00
Cumberland Therapy Services	97.00
Delta T Group	96.67
EDU Healthcare	81.00
Epic Developmental Services	85.67
Maxim Healthcare Services	95.67
Professional Nursing Services (PNS)	96.67
Progressus Therapy	93.33
Sunbelt Staffing	87.67

Non Responsive

CC Com

RFP submitted after the RFPs were due

GHR Education

Not Recommended for Award (Proposals that score less than 80 points)

FEM Nursing Services

Hebron House

Change Resource and Support Services (CRSS)

Staffing Plus

Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers

Vender: Ardor Health Solutions

Nursing Services

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7.5 hour/day) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7.5 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch)
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Registered Nurse (RN) Services				
1 Professional (RN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 50.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 525.00
2 Private Duty (RN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 50.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 525.00

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Licensed Practical Nurse (LPN) Services				
1 Professional (LPN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 40.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 420.00
2 Private Duty (LPN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 40.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 420.00

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Certified Nursing Assistant (CNA) Services				
1 Professional (CNA) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2 Private Duty (CNA) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Special Education Service

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 190 day School Year
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Weekly Rate	Non-Standard Weekly Rates	School Year Rate
Music Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Speech Therapy	\$ 64.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 2,240.00	\$ 3,360.00	\$ 85,120.00
Occupational Therapy	\$ 64.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 2,240.00	\$ 3,360.00	\$ 85,120.00
Physical Therapy	\$ 64.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 2,240.00	\$ 3,360.00	\$ 85,120.00
Teacher of the Deaf and Hard of Hearing Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Teacher of the Visually Impaired Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Psychological Evaluation, English	\$ 64.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 2,240.00	\$ 3,360.00	\$ 85,120.00
Psychological Evaluation, Non-English	\$ 66.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 2,310.00	\$ 3,465.00	\$ 87,780.00

Psychological Evaluation, English

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	\$ 64.00	_____
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	\$ 64.00	_____
Evaluation/Observation	\$ 64.00	No Bid

Languages Offered: Spanish

Psychological Evaluation, Bi-lingual

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	\$ 66.00	_____
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	\$ 66.00	_____
Evaluation/Observation	\$ 66.00	No Bid

**Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers
Vender: Comprehensive Therapy Consultants**

Nursing Services

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7.5 hour/day) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM (7.5 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch)
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Registered Nurse (RN) Services				
1 Professional (RN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2 Private Duty (RN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Licensed Practical Nurse (LPN) Services				
1 Professional (LPN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2 Private Duty (LPN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Certified Nursing Assistant (CNA) Services				
1 Professional (CNA) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2 Private Duty (CNA) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Special Education Service

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 190 day School Year
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Weekly Rate	Non-Standard Weekly Rates	School Year Rate
Music Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Speech Therapy	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 93,100.00
Occupational Therapy	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 93,100.00
Physical Therapy	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 93,100.00
Teacher of the Deaf and Hard of Hearing Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Teacher of the Visually Impaired Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Psychological Evaluation, English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Psychological Evaluation, Non-English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Psychological Evaluation, English

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	No Bid
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	No Bid
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

Languages Offered: _____

Psychological Evaluation, Bi-lingual

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	No Bid
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	No Bid
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers

Vender: Cumberland Therapy Services, LLC

Nursing Services

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7.5 hour/day) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM (7.5 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch)
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Registered Nurse (RN) Services				
1 Professional (RN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2 Private Duty (RN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Licensed Practical Nurse (LPN) Services				
1 Professional (LPN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2 Private Duty (LPN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Certified Nursing Assistant (CNA) Services				
1 Professional (CNA) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2 Private Duty (CNA) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Special Education Service

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 190 day School Year
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Weekly Rate	Non-Standard Weekly Rates	School Year Rate
Music Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Speech Therapy	\$ 75.00	No Bid	\$ 2,625.00	No Bid	\$ 99,750.00
Occupational Therapy	\$ 72.00	No Bid	\$ 2,520.00	No Bid	\$ 95,760.00
Physical Therapy	\$ 74.00	No Bid	\$ 2,590.00	No Bid	\$ 98,420.00
Teacher of the Deaf and Hard of Hearing Overview	\$ 80.00	No Bid	\$ 2,800.00	No Bid	\$ 106,400.00
Teacher of the Visually Impaired Overview	\$ 80.00	No Bid	\$ 2,800.00	No Bid	\$ 106,400.00
Psychological Evaluation, English	\$ 79.00	No Bid	\$ 2,765.00	No Bid	\$ 105,070.00
Psychological Evaluation, Non-English	\$ 84.00	No Bid	\$ 2,940.00	No Bid	\$ 111,720.00

Psychological Evaluation, English

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	\$ 79.00	_____
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	\$ 79.00	_____
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	\$ 1,500.00

Languages Offered: Spanish

Psychological Evaluation, Bi-lingual

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	\$ 84.00	_____
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	\$ 84.00	_____
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	\$ 1,800.00

**Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers
Vender: Delta T Group**

Nursing Services

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7.5 hour/day) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM (7.5 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch)	
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates	
Registered Nurse (RN) Services					
1	Professional (RN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 41.75	\$ 41.75	\$ 313.13	\$ 313.13
2	Private Duty (RN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 41.75	\$ 41.75	\$ 313.13	\$ 313.13

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates	
Licensed Practical Nurse (LPN) Services					
1	Professional (LPN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 31.75	\$ 31.75	\$ 238.13	\$ 238.13
2	Private Duty (LPN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 31.75	\$ 31.75	\$ 238.13	\$ 238.13

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates	
Certified Nursing Assistant (CNA) Services					
1	Professional (CNA) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 157.50	\$ 157.50
2	Private Duty (CNA) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 21.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 157.50	\$ 157.50

Special Education Service

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 190 day School Year
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Weekly Rate	Non-Standard Weekly Rates	School Year Rate
Music Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Speech Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Occupational Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Physical Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Teacher of the Deaf and Hard of Hearing Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Teacher of the Visually Impaired Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Psychological Evaluation, English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Psychological Evaluation, Non-English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Psychological Evaluation, English

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	No Bid
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	No Bid
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

Languages Offered: _____

Psychological Evaluation, Bi-lingual

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	No Bid
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	No Bid
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

Exhibit 2

RFP 2018-39

Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers

Vender: EDU Healthcare

Nursing Services

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7.5 hour/day) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM (7.5 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch)	
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates	
Registered Nurse (RN) Services					
1	Professional (RN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 45.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 337.50	\$ 337.50
2	Private Duty (RN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 45.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 337.50	\$ 337.50

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates	
Licensed Practical Nurse (LPN) Services					
1	Professional (LPN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 292.50	\$ 292.50
2	Private Duty (LPN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 39.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 292.50	\$ 292.50

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates	
Certified Nursing Assistant (CNA) Services					
1	Professional (CNA) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 187.50	\$ 187.50
2	Private Duty (CNA) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 187.50	\$ 187.50

Special Education Service

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 190 day School Year
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Weekly Rate	Non-Standard Weekly Rates	School Year Rate
Music Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Speech Therapy	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 93,100.00
Occupational Therapy	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 93,100.00
Physical Therapy	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 2,450.00	\$ 93,100.00
Teacher of the Deaf and Hard of Hearing Overview	\$ 55.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 1,925.00	\$ 1,925.00	\$ 73,150.00
Teacher of the Visually Impaired Overview	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 2,275.00	\$ 2,275.00	\$ 86,450.00
Psychological Evaluation, English	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Psychological Evaluation, Non-English	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Psychological Evaluation, English

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	\$ 70.00	_____
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	\$ 70.00	_____
Evaluation/Observation	\$ 70.00	No Bid

Languages Offered: _____

Psychological Evaluation, Bi-lingual

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	\$ 75.00	_____
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	\$ 75.00	_____
Evaluation/Observation	\$ 75.00	No Bid

Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers

Vender: Epic Development Services

Nursing Services

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7.5 hour/day) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM (7.5 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch)
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Registered Nurse (RN) Services				
1 Professional (RN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 45.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 337.50	\$ 337.50
2 Private Duty (RN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 45.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 337.50	\$ 337.50

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Licensed Practical Nurse (LPN) Services				
1 Professional (LPN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 262.50	\$ 262.50
2 Private Duty (LPN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 262.50	\$ 262.50

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Certified Nursing Assistant (CNA) Services				
1 Professional (CNA) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 165.00
2 Private Duty (CNA) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 165.00

Special Education Service

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 190 day School Year
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Weekly Rate	Non-Standard Weekly Rates	School Year Rate
Music Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Speech Therapy	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 4,375.00	\$ 4,375.00	\$ 166,250.00
Occupational Therapy	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 4,375.00	\$ 4,375.00	\$ 166,250.00
Physical Therapy	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 4,375.00	\$ 4,375.00	\$ 166,250.00
Teacher of the Deaf and Hard of Hearing Overview	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 3,150.00	\$ 3,150.00	\$ 119,700.00
Teacher of the Visually Impaired Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Psychological Evaluation, English	\$ 175.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 6,125.00	\$ 6,125.00	\$ 232,750.00
Psychological Evaluation, Non-English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Psychological Evaluation, English

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	\$ 175.00	_____
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	\$ 175.00	_____
Evaluation/Observation	\$ 175.00	No Bid

Languages Offered: _____

Psychological Evaluation, Bi-lingual

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	_____
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	_____
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

Exhibit 2

RFP 2018-39

Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers

Vender: Maxim Healthcare Services

Nursing Services

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM Standard Hourly Rate	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Monday-Friday (7.5 hour/day) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM Standard Daily Rate	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7.5 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Non-Standard Daily Rates
Registered Nurse (RN) Services				
1 Professional (RN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 50.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 525.00
2 Private Duty (RN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 53.00	\$ 79.50	\$ 397.50	\$ 556.50

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Licensed Practical Nurse (LPN) Services				
1 Professional (LPN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 45.00	\$ 67.50	\$ 337.50	\$ 472.50
2 Private Duty (LPN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 42.00	\$ 63.00	\$ 315.00	\$ 441.00

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Certified Nursing Assistant (CNA) Services				
1 Professional (CNA) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 25.00	\$ 37.50	\$ 187.50	\$ 262.50
2 Private Duty (CNA) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 26.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 273.00

Special Education Service

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM Standard Hourly Rate	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM Standard Weekly Rate	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Holiday's Non-Standard Weekly Rates	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 190 day School Year School Year Rate
Music Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Speech Therapy	\$ 79.00	\$ 118.50	\$ 2,765.00	\$ 4,147.50	\$ 105,070.00
Occupational Therapy	\$ 77.00	\$ 115.50	\$ 2,695.00	\$ 4,042.50	\$ 102,410.00
Physical Therapy	\$ 76.00	\$ 114.00	\$ 2,660.00	\$ 3,990.00	\$ 101,080.00
Teacher of the Deaf and Hard of Hearing Overview	\$ 69.00	\$ 103.50	\$ 2,415.00	\$ 3,622.50	\$ 91,770.00
Teacher of the Visually Impaired Overview	\$ 69.00	\$ 103.50	\$ 2,415.00	\$ 3,622.50	\$ 91,770.00
Psychological Evaluation, English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Psychological Evaluation, Non-English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Psychological Evaluation, English

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	No Bid
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	No Bid
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

Languages Offered: _____

Psychological Evaluation, Bi-lingual

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	No Bid
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	No Bid
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

**Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers
Vendor: Professional Nursing Services (PNS)**

Nursing Services

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7.5 hour/day) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM (7.5 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch)
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Registered Nurse (RN) Services				
1 Professional (RN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 51.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 382.50	\$ 457.50
2 Private Duty (RN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 51.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 382.50	\$ 457.50

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Licensed Practical Nurse (LPN) Services				
1 Professional (LPN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 38.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 360.00
2 Private Duty (LPN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 38.00	\$ 48.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 360.00

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Certified Nursing Assistant (CNA) Services				
1 Professional (CNA) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2 Private Duty (CNA) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Special Education Service

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 190 day School Year
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Weekly Rate	Non-Standard Weekly Rates	School Year Rate
Music Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Speech Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Occupational Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Physical Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Teacher of the Deaf and Hard of Hearing Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Teacher of the Visually Impaired Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Psychological Evaluation, English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Psychological Evaluation, Non-English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Psychological Evaluation, English

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	No Bid
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	No Bid
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

Languages Offered: _____

Psychological Evaluation, Bi-lingual

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	No Bid
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	No Bid
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers

Vender: Progressus Therapy

Nursing Services

		Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7.5 hour/day) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7.5 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch)
Registered Nurse (RN) Services		Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
1	Professional (RN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Private Duty (RN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

		Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Licensed Practical Nurse (LPN) Services					
1	Professional (LPN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Private Duty (LPN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

		Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Certified Nursing Assistant (CNA) Services					
1	Professional (CNA) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Private Duty (CNA) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Special Education Service

		Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 190 day School Year
		Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Weekly Rate	Non-Standard Weekly Rates	School Year Rate
	Music Therapy	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Speech Therapy	\$ 72.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Occupational Therapy	\$ 72.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Physical Therapy	\$ 72.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Teacher of the Deaf and Hard of Hearing Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Teacher of the Visually Impaired Overview	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Psychological Evaluation, English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Psychological Evaluation, Non-English	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Psychological Evaluation, English

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	No Bid
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	No Bid
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

Languages Offered: _____

Psychological Evaluation, Bi-lingual

	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	No Bid	No Bid
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	No Bid	No Bid
Evaluation/Observation	No Bid	No Bid

Unit Price Contract for Nursing and Special Education Service Providers

Vender: Sunbelt Staffing

Nursing Services

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7.5 hour/day) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	PM to 6:00 AM (7.5 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch)
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Registered Nurse (RN) Services				
1 Professional (RN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 71.50	\$ 80.00	\$ 536.25	\$ 400.00
2 Private Duty (RN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 71.50	\$ 80.00	\$ 536.25	\$ 400.00

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Licensed Practical Nurse (LPN) Services				
1 Professional (LPN) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 67.50	\$ 76.00	\$ 506.25	\$ 532.00
2 Private Duty (LPN) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 67.50	\$ 76.00	\$ 506.25	\$ 532.00

	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Daily Rate	Non-Standard Daily Rates
Certified Nursing Assistant (CNA) Services				
1 Professional (CNA) Nurse (WCPS maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 50.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 406.00
2 Private Duty (CNA) Nursing (Agency maintains up to date physician orders, health care plans, and nursing assessments)	\$ 50.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 406.00

Special Education Service

	Monday-Friday 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM, Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 6:00 AM to 6:00 PM	Monday-Friday 6:00 PM to 6:00 AM (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) Weekends and WCPS Holiday's	Monday-Friday (7 hour/day - unpaid .5 hour lunch) 190 day School Year
	Standard Hourly Rate	Non-Standard Hourly Rates	Standard Weekly Rate	Non-Standard Weekly Rates	School Year Rate
Music Therapy	\$ 72.00	\$ 82.00	\$ 2,520.00	\$ 2,870.00	\$ 95,760.00
Speech Therapy	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 2,625.00	\$ 2,975.00	\$ 99,750.00
Occupational Therapy	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 2,625.00	\$ 2,975.00	\$ 99,750.00
Physical Therapy	\$ 78.00	\$ 88.00	\$ 2,730.00	\$ 3,080.00	\$ 103,740.00
Teacher of the Deaf and Hard of Hearing Overview	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 2,625.00	\$ 2,975.00	\$ 99,750.00
Teacher of the Visually Impaired Overview	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 2,625.00	\$ 2,975.00	\$ 99,750.00
Psychological Evaluation, English	\$ 78.00	\$ 88.00	\$ 2,730.00	\$ 3,080.00	\$ 103,740.00
Psychological Evaluation, Non-English	\$ 82.00	\$ 92.00	\$ 2,870.00	\$ 3,220.00	\$ 109,060.00

Psychological Evaluation, English	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	\$ 78.00	500.00
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	\$ 78.00	500.00
Evaluation/Observation	\$ 78.00	\$ 500.00

Languages Offered: English
Spanish
Any Other Requested Language

Psychological Evaluation, Bi-lingual	Hourly Rate	Flat Fee
Phone contact with Parent	\$ 82.00	700.00
Individualized Education Program (IEP)	\$ 82.00	700.00
Evaluation/Observation	\$ 82.00	\$ 700.00