

Bid 2023-42 New Vehicle Bid

Bid Tab

	Criswell Fleet Sales	Ideal Buick Inc.	Pacifico Ford Inc.	The Frederick Motor Co., Ford Fleet
Vehicles				
Sedan - New, Like or Similar to Chevrolet Malibu	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Buick	\$ 450.00			
Chevrolet	\$ 450.00			
Chrysler	\$ 450.00			
Dodge	\$ 450.00			
Ford	\$ 650.00		No Bid	Not Applicable
Honda	\$ 1,250.00			
Toyota	No Bid			

SUV (small) - New, Like or Similar to Chevrolet Equinox	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Buick	\$ 650.00	\$ (500.00)		
Chevrolet	\$ 650.00			
Chrysler	\$ 650.00			
Dodge	\$ 650.00			
Ford	\$ 850.00		\$ 1,280.00	\$ 273.00
GMC	\$ 650.00	\$ (500.00)		
Honda	\$ 1,850.00			
Toyota	No Bid			

Bid 2023-42 New Vehicle Bid

Bid Tab

	Criswell Fleet Sales	Ideal Buick Inc.	Pacifico Ford Inc.	The Frederick Motor Co., Ford Fleet
Vehicles				
SUV (mid-size) - New, Like or Similar to Ford Explorer	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Buick	\$ 850.00	\$ (700.00)		
Chevrolet	\$ 850.00			
Chrysler	\$ 850.00			
Dodge	\$ 850.00			
Ford	\$ 1,550.00		\$ 1,310.00	\$ 273.00
GMC	\$ 850.00	\$ (650.00)		
Honda	\$ 1,950.00			
Toyota	No Bid			

SUV (Large) - New, Like or Similar to Chevrolet Tahoe	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Buick	\$ 2,250.00			
Chevrolet	\$ 2,250.00			
Chrysler	\$ 2,250.00			
Dodge	\$ 2,250.00			
Ford	\$ 3,500.00		\$ 1,900.00	\$ (127.00)
GMC	\$ 2,250.00	\$ (850.00)		
Honda	\$ 3,500.00			
Toyota	No Bid			

Bid 2023-42 New Vehicle Bid

Bid Tab

	Criswell Fleet Sales	Ideal Buick Inc.	Pacifico Ford Inc.	The Frederick Motor Co., Ford Fleet
Vehicles				
Passenger Van (Mini) New, Like or Similar to Ford Transit Connect or Toyota Siennas	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 3,500.00			
Chrysler	\$ 3,500.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 3,500.00			
Ford	\$ 3,500.00		\$ 1,280.00	\$ 1,073.00
Honda	\$ 5,500.00			
Toyota	No Bid			

Passenger Van (Full Size) - New, Like or Similar to Ford Transit	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 3,500.00			
Chrysler	\$ 3,500.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 3,500.00			
Ford	\$ 4,500.00		\$ 1,830.00	\$ 384.00
Honda	\$ 3,500.00			
Toyota	No Bid			

Bid 2023-42 New Vehicle Bid

Bid Tab

Vehicles	Criswell Fleet Sales	Ideal Buick Inc.	Pacifico Ford Inc.	The Frederick Motor Co., Ford Fleet
Cargo Van (Full Size) New, Like or Similar to Ford Transit	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 3,500.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 4,500.00			
Ford	\$ 5,000.00		\$ 1,830.00	\$ 384.00
Mercedes / Sprinter	No Bid			
Freightliner / Sprinter	No Bid			

Truck (Class 1) - New, Like or Similar to Chevrolet Colorado	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 3,500.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 3,500.00			
Ford	\$ 4,500.00		\$ 1,275.00	\$ 146.00
GMC	\$ 3,500.00	\$ (600.00)		
Toyota	No Bid			

Truck (Class 2a) - New, Like or Similar to Chevrolet Silverado 1500	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 4,250.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 4,250.00			
Ford	\$ 5,500.00		\$ 1,490.00	\$ (927.00)
GMC	\$ 4,250.00	\$ (700.00)		
Toyota	No Bid			

Bid 2023-42 New Vehicle Bid

Bid Tab

Vehicles	Criswell Fleet Sales	Ideal Buick Inc.	Pacifico Ford Inc.	The Frederick Motor Co., Ford Fleet
Truck (Class 2b) - New, Like or Similar to Chevrolet Silverado 2500	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 4,250.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 4,250.00			
Ford	\$ 5,500.00		\$ 1,670.00	\$ 284.00
GMC	\$ 4,250.00	\$ (750.00)		
Toyota	No Bid			

Truck (Class 3) - New, Like or Similar to Chevrolet Silverado 3500	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 4,250.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 4,250.00			
Ford	\$ 5,500.00		\$ 1,910.00	\$ 573.00
GMC	\$ 4,250.00	\$ (800.00)		

Truck (Class 4) - New, Like or Similar to Chevrolet Silverado 4500	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 5,500.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 6,000.00			
Ford	\$ 6,000.00		\$ 1,910.00	\$ 473.00
GMC	\$ 5,500.00			

Bid 2023-42 New Vehicle Bid

Bid Tab

	Criswell Fleet Sales	Ideal Buick Inc.	Pacifico Ford Inc.	The Frederick Motor Co., Ford Fleet
Vehicles				
Truck (Class 5) - New, Like or Similar to Chevrolet Silverado 5500	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 5,500.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 6,000.00			
Ford	\$ 6,000.00		\$ 1,910.00	\$ 373.00
GMC	\$ 6,000.00			
Freightliner	No Bid			
Kenworth	No Bid			
Peterbilt	No Bid			

Truck (Class 6) - New, Like or Similar to Chevrolet Silverado 6500	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 5,500.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 6,000.00			
Ford	\$ 6,000.00		\$ 2,430.00	\$ 433.00
GMC	\$ 5,500.00			
Freightliner	No Bid			
Kenworth	No Bid			
Peterbilt	No Bid			

**Bid 2023-42 New Vehicle Bid
Bid Tab**

Vehicles	Criswell Fleet Sales	Ideal Buick Inc.	Pacifico Ford Inc.	The Frederick Motor Co., Ford Fleet
Truck (Class 7) - New, Like or Similar to Freightliner M2 106	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost	Maximum Cost Above (+) Dealer Invoice Cost <u>OR</u> Minimum Cost below (-) Dealer Invoice Cost
Chevrolet	\$ 5,500.00			
Dodge / Ram	\$ 6,000.00			
Ford	\$ 6,000.00		\$ 3,300.00	\$ (2,516.00)
GMC	\$ 5,500.00			
Freightliner	No Bid			
Kenworth	No Bid			
Peterbilt	No Bid			