

**Bid 2024-12
Kitchen Smallwares and Small Equipment
Bid Tabulation**

Group 1 - Spoodles & Dishers - No Substitutions - Price must be for the Brand and Model Listed					Sam Tell and Sons, Inc.		MTS Equipment		Johnnies, Inc.		Douglas Equipment	
Item	Item Description	Brand	Model	Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	Solid Spoodle, 1 oz	Vollrath	61147	13	\$ 12.83	\$ 166.79	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 153.40	\$ 10.15	\$ 131.95
2	Solid Spoodle, 2 oz	Vollrath	61157	16	\$ 12.83	\$ 205.28	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 188.80	\$ 10.18	\$ 162.88
3	Solid Spoodle, 3 oz	Vollrath	61167	10	\$ 12.83	\$ 128.30	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 118.00	\$ 10.22	\$ 102.20
4	Solid Spoodle, 4 oz	Vollrath	62172	27	\$ 12.83	\$ 346.41	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 318.60	\$ 10.27	\$ 277.29
5	Solid Spoodle, 6 oz	Vollrath	61177	25	\$ 13.50	\$ 337.50	No Bid		\$ 12.42	\$ 310.50	\$ 10.93	\$ 273.25
6	Solid Spoodle, 8 oz	Vollrath	61182	18	\$ 13.50	\$ 243.00	No Bid		\$ 12.42	\$ 223.56	\$ 10.98	\$ 197.64
7	Perforated Spoodle, 1 oz	Vollrath	61145	5	\$ 12.83	\$ 64.15	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 59.00	\$ 10.16	\$ 50.80
8	Perforated Spoodle, 2 oz	Vollrath	61155	9	\$ 12.83	\$ 115.47	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 106.20	\$ 10.18	\$ 91.62
9	Perforated Spoodle, 3 oz	Vollrath	61165	10	\$ 12.83	\$ 128.30	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 118.00	\$ 10.22	\$ 102.20
10	Perforated Spoodle, 4 oz	Vollrath	61170	35	\$ 12.83	\$ 449.05	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 413.00	\$ 10.29	\$ 360.15
11	Perforated Spoodle, 6 oz	Vollrath	61175	19	\$ 13.50	\$ 256.50	No Bid		\$ 12.42	\$ 235.98	\$ 10.93	\$ 207.67
12	Perforated Spoodle, 8 oz	Vollrath	61180	10	\$ 13.50	\$ 135.00	No Bid		\$ 12.42	\$ 124.20	\$ 10.98	\$ 109.80
13	Disher #6	Vollrath	47139	2	\$ 12.83	\$ 25.66	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 23.60	\$ 10.66	\$ 21.32
14	Disher, #8	Vollrath	47140	6	\$ 12.83	\$ 76.98	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 70.80	\$ 10.66	\$ 63.96
15	Disher, #10	Vollrath	47141	6	\$ 12.83	\$ 76.98	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 70.80	\$ 10.54	\$ 63.24
16	Disher, #16	Vollrath	47143	3	\$ 12.83	\$ 38.49	No Bid		\$ 11.80	\$ 35.40	\$ 10.49	\$ 31.47
					\$ 2,793.86		\$ -		\$ 2,569.84		\$ 2,247.44	

Group 2 - Thermometers - No Substitutions - Price must be for the Brand and Model Listed					Sam Tell and Sons, Inc.		MTS Equipment		Johnnies, Inc.		Douglas Equipment	
Item	Item Description	Brand	Model	Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
17	Instant Read Thermometer	Cooper-Atkins	1246-0-1	100	\$ 7.74	\$ 774.00	\$ 7.92	\$ 792.00	\$ 8.61	\$ 861.00	\$ 7.20	\$ 720.00
18	Large Dial Thermometer	Taylor	8018N	31	\$ 7.66	\$ 237.46	\$ 8.80	\$ 272.80	\$ 6.50	\$ 201.50	\$ 9.63	\$ 298.53
19	Digital Thermometer	Cooper-Atkins	DPP400W	111	\$ 24.13	\$ 2,678.43	\$ 21.80	\$ 2,419.80	\$ 26.85	\$ 2,980.35	\$ 22.27	\$ 2,471.97
20	Oven Thermometer	Cooper-Atkins	24HP-01-1	25	\$ 6.39	\$ 159.75	\$ 6.85	\$ 171.25	\$ 7.11	\$ 177.75	\$ 6.20	\$ 155.00
21	Freezer/Refrig Thermometer	Taylor	3503FS	75	\$ 2.78	\$ 208.50	\$ 4.85	\$ 363.75	\$ 2.37	\$ 177.75	\$ 3.83	\$ 287.25
22	Freezer/Refrig Thermometer	Cooper-Atkins	25HP-01-1	60	\$ 6.39	\$ 383.40	\$ 6.85	\$ 411.00	\$ 7.11	\$ 426.60	\$ 6.01	\$ 360.60
					\$ 4,441.54		\$ 4,430.60		\$ 4,824.95		\$ 4,293.35	

Group 3 - Pans and Storage Containers - No Substitutions - Price must be for the Brand and Model Listed					Sam Tell and Sons, Inc.		MTS Equipment		Johnnies, Inc.		Douglas Equipment	
Item	Item Description	Brand	Model	Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
23	Hotel Pan, Full Size, 2"	Vollrath	30022	12	\$ 27.79	\$ 333.48	No Bid		\$ 25.56	\$ 306.72	\$ 22.58	\$ 270.96
24	Hotel Pan, Full Size, 4"	Vollrath	30042	10	\$ 37.29	\$ 372.90	No Bid		\$ 34.31	\$ 343.10	\$ 30.20	\$ 302.00
25	Hotel Pan, Full Size, 6"	Vollrath	30062	6	\$ 55.69	\$ 334.14	No Bid		\$ 51.23	\$ 307.38	\$ 44.47	\$ 266.82
26	Hotel Pan, Full Size, Lids	Vollrath	77200	14	\$ 57.21	\$ 800.94	No Bid		\$ 52.63	\$ 736.82	\$ 44.46	\$ 622.44
27	Hotel Pan, 1/2 size, 2"	Vollrath	30222	32	\$ 17.27	\$ 552.64	No Bid		\$ 15.89	\$ 508.48	\$ 14.00	\$ 448.00
28	Hotel Pan, 1/2 size, 4"	Vollrath	30242	40	\$ 24.75	\$ 990.00	No Bid		\$ 22.77	\$ 910.80	\$ 19.81	\$ 792.40
29	Hotel Pan, 1/2 size, 6"	Vollrath	30262	10	\$ 34.48	\$ 344.80	No Bid		\$ 31.72	\$ 317.20	\$ 27.40	\$ 274.00
30	Hotel Pan, 1/2 size, Lids	Vollrath	77500	12	\$ 53.10	\$ 637.20	No Bid		\$ 48.85	\$ 586.20	\$ 40.99	\$ 491.88
31	Hotel Pan, 1/3 size, 2"	Vollrath	30322	24	\$ 15.86	\$ 380.64	No Bid		\$ 14.59	\$ 350.16	\$ 12.70	\$ 304.80
32	Hotel Pan, 1/3 size, 4"	Vollrath	30342	40	\$ 22.89	\$ 915.60	No Bid		\$ 21.06	\$ 842.40	\$ 18.16	\$ 726.40
33	Hotel Pan, 1/3 size, 6"	Vollrath	30362	2	\$ 32.96	\$ 65.92	No Bid		\$ 30.33	\$ 60.66	\$ 25.97	\$ 51.94
34	Hotel Pan, 1/3 size, Lid	Vollrath	75230	20	\$ 15.08	\$ 301.60	No Bid		\$ 13.87	\$ 277.40	\$ 11.66	\$ 233.20
35	Hotel Pan, 1/4 size, 4"	Vollrath	30442	2	\$ 20.87	\$ 41.74	No Bid		\$ 19.20	\$ 38.40	\$ 16.46	\$ 32.92
36	Hotel Pan, 1/4 size, 6"	Vollrath	30462	3	\$ 29.64	\$ 88.92	No Bid		\$ 27.27	\$ 81.81	\$ 23.25	\$ 69.75
37	Hotel Pan, 1/4 size, Lid	Vollrath	75240	7	\$ 13.28	\$ 92.96	No Bid		\$ 12.21	\$ 85.47	\$ 10.25	\$ 71.75
38	Hotel Pan, 1/6 size, 2"	Vollrath	30622	6	\$ 11.59	\$ 69.54	No Bid		\$ 10.66	\$ 63.96	\$ 9.16	\$ 54.96
39	Hotel Pan, 1/6 size, Lid	Vollrath	75260	2	\$ 10.13	\$ 20.26	No Bid		\$ 9.32	\$ 18.64	\$ 8.37	\$ 16.74
40	Hotel Pan, Perforated, full size, 2"	Vollrath	30023	2	\$ 49.05	\$ 98.10	No Bid		\$ 45.13	\$ 90.26	\$ 38.65	\$ 77.30

Exhibit 6

41	Hotel Pan, Perforated, full size, 4 "	Vollrath	30043	4	\$ 61.37	\$ 245.48	No Bid		\$ 56.46	\$ 225.84	\$ 48.36	\$ 193.44
42	Hotel Pan, Perforated, full size, 6 "	Vollrath	30063	1	\$ 93.60	\$ 93.60	No Bid		\$ 86.11	\$ 86.11	\$ 73.10	\$ 73.10
43	Hotel Pan, Perforated, 1/2 size, 2 "	Vollrath	30223	2	\$ 32.57	\$ 65.14	No Bid		\$ 29.96	\$ 59.92	\$ 25.54	\$ 51.08
44	Hotel Pan, Perforated, 1/2 size, 4 "	Vollrath	30243	7	\$ 40.28	\$ 281.96	No Bid		\$ 37.05	\$ 259.35	\$ 31.57	\$ 220.99
45	Hotel Pan, Perforated, 1/2 size, 6 "	Vollrath	30263	1	\$ 70.20	\$ 70.20	No Bid		\$ 64.58	\$ 64.58	\$ 54.44	\$ 54.44
46	Translucent Full Size Pan, 4"	Cambro	14PP190	4	\$ 10.38	\$ 41.52	No Bid		\$ 11.52	\$ 46.08	\$ 14.47	\$ 57.88
47	Translucent Full Size Pan, 6"	Cambro	16PP190	2	\$ 13.29	\$ 26.58	No Bid		\$ 12.55	\$ 25.10	\$ 19.18	\$ 38.36
48	Translucent Full Size Pan Lid	Cambro	10PPCWSC190	2	\$ 7.53	\$ 15.06	No Bid		\$ 7.11	\$ 14.22	\$ 17.06	\$ 34.12
49	Translucent 1/2 Size Pan, 6"	Cambro	26PP190	12	\$ 8.08	\$ 96.96	No Bid		\$ 7.63	\$ 91.56	\$ 11.37	\$ 136.44
50	Translucent 1/2 Size Pan Lid	Cambro	20PPCWSC190	6	\$ 4.59	\$ 27.54	No Bid		\$ 4.33	\$ 25.98	\$ 4.38	\$ 26.28
51	Translucent 1/3 Size Pan, 4"	Cambro	34PP190	6	\$ 5.16	\$ 30.96	No Bid		\$ 4.87	\$ 29.22	\$ 4.96	\$ 29.76
52	Translucent 1/3 Size Pan, 6"	Cambro	36PP190	3	\$ 5.93	\$ 17.79	No Bid		\$ 5.60	\$ 16.80	\$ 5.81	\$ 17.43
53	Translucent 1/3 Size Pan Lid	Cambro	30PPCWSC190	7	\$ 3.49	\$ 24.43	No Bid		\$ 3.29	\$ 23.03	\$ 3.20	\$ 22.40
54	Translucent 1/4 Size Pan, 6"	Cambro	46PP190	3	\$ 5.16	\$ 15.48	No Bid		\$ 4.87	\$ 14.61	\$ 6.24	\$ 18.72
55	Translucent 1/4 Size Pan Lid	Cambro	40PPCWSC190	3	\$ 3.06	\$ 9.18	No Bid		\$ 2.89	\$ 8.67	\$ 3.13	\$ 9.39
56	Lexan Pan, Full Size, 4"	Cambro	18263CW135	6	\$ 25.94	\$ 155.64	No Bid		\$ 28.71	\$ 172.26	\$ 29.83	\$ 178.98
57	Lexan Pan, Full Size, 6"	Cambro	18266CW135	25	\$ 33.59	\$ 839.75	No Bid		\$ 37.30	\$ 932.50	\$ 33.23	\$ 830.75
58	Lexan Pan, Full Size, 8"	Cambro	18269CW135	25	\$ 44.23	\$ 1,105.75	No Bid		\$ 49.12	\$ 1,228.00	\$ 43.85	\$ 1,096.25
59	Lexan Pan, Full Size, Lids	Cambro	1826CCW135	112	\$ 17.62	\$ 1,973.44	No Bid		\$ 19.57	\$ 2,191.84	\$ 19.39	\$ 2,171.68
60	Lexan Pan, Half Size, 4"	Cambro	12183CW135	9	\$ 14.20	\$ 127.80	No Bid		\$ 15.77	\$ 141.93	\$ 16.64	\$ 149.76
61	Lexan Pan, Half Size, 6"	Cambro	12186CW135	44	\$ 17.98	\$ 791.12	No Bid		\$ 19.97	\$ 878.68	\$ 19.14	\$ 842.16
62	Lexan Pan, Half Size, 8"	Cambro	12189CW135	10	\$ 24.26	\$ 242.60	No Bid		\$ 26.95	\$ 269.50	\$ 23.57	\$ 235.70
63	Lexan Pan, Half Size, Lids	Cambro	1218CCW135	37	\$ 8.77	\$ 324.49	No Bid		\$ 9.74	\$ 360.38	\$ 10.26	\$ 379.62
64	Lexan Pan, Third size, 4"	Cambro	34CW135	10	\$ 7.20	\$ 72.00	No Bid		\$ 6.79	\$ 67.90	\$ 8.20	\$ 82.00
65	Lexan Pan, Third Size, 6"	Cambro	36CW135	10	\$ 8.44	\$ 84.40	No Bid		\$ 7.97	\$ 79.70	\$ 9.72	\$ 97.20
66	Lexan Pan, Third Size, 8"	Cambro	38CW135	2	\$ 10.78	\$ 21.56	No Bid		\$ 10.18	\$ 20.36	\$ 12.56	\$ 25.12
67	Lexan Pan, Third Size, Lids	Cambro	30CWC135	22	\$ 4.06	\$ 89.32	No Bid		\$ 3.84	\$ 84.48	\$ 4.05	\$ 89.10
68	Translucent Square 2 qt	Cambro	2SFSP190	37	\$ 4.58	\$ 169.46	No Bid		\$ 4.32	\$ 159.84	\$ 4.21	\$ 155.77
69	Translucent Square 4 qt	Cambro	4SFSP190	42	\$ 6.25	\$ 262.50	No Bid		\$ 5.90	\$ 247.80	\$ 5.89	\$ 247.38
70	Translucent Square 6 qt	Cambro	6SFSP190	51	\$ 7.75	\$ 395.25	No Bid		\$ 7.31	\$ 372.81	\$ 7.29	\$ 371.79
71	Translucent Square Lids 2/4 qt.	Cambro	SFC2452	41	\$ 2.21	\$ 90.53	No Bid		\$ 2.15	\$ 88.15	\$ 2.02	\$ 82.82
72	Translucent Square Lids 6 qt	Cambro	SFC6451	35	\$ 2.84	\$ 99.40	No Bid		\$ 2.68	\$ 93.80	\$ 2.58	\$ 90.30
					\$ 14,348.27	\$ -			\$ 14,306.86	\$ 13,218.47		

Group 4 - Can Openers - No Substitutions - Price must be for the Brand and Model Listed					Sam Tell and Sons, Inc.		MTS Equipment		Johnnies, Inc.		Douglas Equipment	
Item	Item Description	Brand	Model	Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
73	Electric Can Opener	Edlund	270	5	\$ 1,780.88	\$ 8,904.40	\$ 1,780.88	\$ 8,904.40	\$ 1,693.02	\$ 8,465.10	\$ 1,453.45	\$ 7,267.25
74	Knife & Gear Replacement	Edlund	KT2700 KIT	6	\$ 807.50	\$ 4,845.00	\$ 807.50	\$ 4,845.00	\$ 127.05	\$ 762.30	\$ 648.38	\$ 3,890.28
					\$ 13,749.40	\$ 13,749.40			\$ 9,227.40	\$ 11,157.53		

Group 5 - Various Kitchen Equipment - No Substitutions - Price must be for the Brand and Model Listed					Sam Tell and Sons, Inc.		MTS Equipment		Johnnies, Inc.		Douglas Equipment	
Item	Item Description	Brand	Model	Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
75	Hot Pads, Round, 12 pack	Intedge	318RD	58	No Award		No Award		No Award		No Award	
76	Dishtowels, 12 pack	CPI	M16CLOTH300K	75	\$ 4.13	\$ 309.75	\$ 15.90	\$ 1,192.50	No Bid		\$ 10.46	\$ 784.50
77	Insulated Transport Bag	Carry Hot USA	MT - Blue	135	\$ 41.24	\$ 5,567.40	\$ 58.00	\$ 7,830.00	\$ 64.71	\$ 8,735.85	\$ 62.33	\$ 8,414.55
78	Insulated Transport Bag	Carry Hot USA	MCT - Blue	40	\$ 73.41	\$ 2,936.40	\$ 61.00	\$ 2,440.00	\$ 61.26	\$ 2,450.40	\$ 68.31	\$ 2,732.40
79	Ice Sheets, 12 count case	Flexi Freeze	88 count sheet	18	No Award		No Award		No Award		No Award	
80	Dish Rack, flatware	Vollrath	52671	8	\$ 29.42	\$ 235.36	\$ 39.00	\$ 312.00	\$ 27.07	\$ 216.56	\$ 29.82	\$ 238.56
81	Dish Rack, plate & tray	Vollrath	52695	4	\$ 30.43	\$ 121.72	\$ 39.85	\$ 159.40	\$ 28.00	\$ 112.00	\$ 31.18	\$ 124.72
82	Insulated Beverage Dispenser	Cambro	500LCD186	1	\$ 163.80	\$ 163.80	\$ 209.00	\$ 209.00	\$ 193.28	\$ 193.28	\$ 181.38	\$ 181.38
83	Pizza Cutter	Dexter Russell	18023	66	\$ 21.18	\$ 1,397.88	\$ 21.40	\$ 1,412.40	\$ 22.21	\$ 1,465.86	\$ 19.96	\$ 1,317.36

► Delivered to Center for Education Services, Att. David Reese, 10435 Downsville Pike, Hagerstown MD 21740 (Please see Section II, Number 5 for additional details)

Item 76 - Sam Tell and Sons and Douglas did not quote specified item.

Item 77 - Sam Tell and Sons did not quote specified item.

Exhibit 6

Group 6 - Like or Similar - Quality Similar to the listed Brand and Model will be considered					Sam Tell and Sons, Inc.					MTS Equipment					Johannes, Inc.					Douglas Equipment				
Item	Item Description	Reference Brand	Reference Model	Vendor Brand	Vendor Model	Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Vendor Brand	Vendor Model	Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Vendor Brand	Vendor Model	Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	Vendor Brand	Vendor Model	Estimated Quantity	Unit Price	Total Price	
84	Portion Control Scale, 1 lb.	Edlund	SS-16	Edlund	SS-16	2	\$ 105.75	\$ 211.50			2	No Bid		Edlund	SS-16	2	\$ 100.53	\$ 201.06	Edlund	SS-16	2	\$ 87.42	\$ 174.84	
85	Portion Control Scale, 2 lb.	Edlund	HD-2	Edlund	HD-2	2	\$ 230.63	\$ 461.26			2	No Bid		Edlund	HD-2	2	\$ 219.25	\$ 438.50	Edlund	HD-2	2	\$ 188.73	\$ 377.46	
86	Measuring Cup Set	Cambro	5-piece Poly	Stanton Trading	1047	6	\$ 3.21	\$ 19.26			6	No Bid		Vollrath	47119	6	\$ 18.16	\$ 108.96	Webstraunt	214MCUPKITCL	6	\$ 57.49	\$ 344.94	
87	Measuring Cup - Pint	Cambro	50MCCW135	Cambro	50MCCW135	2	\$ 8.44	\$ 16.88			2	No Bid		Cambro	50MCCW135	2	\$ 7.97	\$ 15.94	Cambro	50MCCW135	2	\$ 7.15	\$ 14.30	
88	Measuring Cup - Quart	Cambro	100MCCW135	Cambro	100MCCW135	2	\$ 9.51	\$ 19.02			2	No Bid		Cambro	100MCCW135	2	\$ 8.97	\$ 17.94	Cambro	100MCCW135	2	\$ 8.21	\$ 16.42	
89	Measuring Cup - 1/2 Gallon	Cambro	200MCCW135	Cambro	200MCCW135	1	\$ 13.11	\$ 13.11			1	No Bid		Cambro	200MCCW135	1	\$ 12.37	\$ 12.37	Cambro	200MCCW135	1	\$ 11.50	\$ 11.50	
90	Measuring Cup - Gallon	Cambro	400MCCW135	Cambro	400MCCW135	6	\$ 14.23	\$ 85.38			6	No Bid		Cambro	400MCCW135	6	\$ 13.43	\$ 80.58	Cambro	400MCCW135	6	\$ 13.43	\$ 80.58	
91	Measuring Spoon Set, 18/8 Stainless Steel	Vollrath	46588	Stanton Trading	933	6	\$ 0.66	\$ 3.96			6	No Bid		Vollrath	46588	6	\$ 16.15	\$ 96.90	Vollrath	46588	6	\$ 14.02	\$ 84.12	
92	Ice Scoops - 8 oz	OXO	1067686	Royal Industries	ROY SPC 6	2	\$ 2.19	\$ 4.38			2	No Bid		OXO	1067686	2	\$ 10.61	\$ 21.22	Webstraunt	1067686	2	\$ 17.23	\$ 34.46	
93	Ice Scoops - 24 oz	Choice		Royal Industries	ROY SPC 24	1	\$ 3.94	\$ 3.94			1	No Bid		Cambro	SCP24C135	1	\$ 6.05	\$ 6.05	Webstraunt	176PCSCOOP24	1	\$ 18.25	\$ 18.25	
94	Tongs, Plastic, 6"	Cambro	6TGS110	Cambro	6TGS110	2	\$ 1.58	\$ 3.16			2	No Bid		Cambro	6TGS110	2	\$ 1.75	\$ 3.50	Cambro	6TGS110	2	\$ 1.42	\$ 2.84	
95	Tongs, Plastic, 9"	Cambro	9TGS110	Cambro	9TGS110	2	\$ 2.39	\$ 4.78			2	No Bid		Cambro	9TGS110	2	\$ 2.66	\$ 5.32	Cambro	9TGS110	2	\$ 2.07	\$ 4.14	
96	Ladle, 1 oz	Vollrath	4980110	Vollrath	4980110	14	\$ 11.87	\$ 166.18			14	No Bid		Vollrath	4980110	14	\$ 10.92	\$ 152.88	Vollrath	4980110	14	\$ 9.44	\$ 132.16	
97	Ladle, 2 oz	Vollrath	4980210	Vollrath	4980210	12	\$ 13.22	\$ 158.64			12	No Bid		Vollrath	4980210	12	\$ 12.16	\$ 145.92	Vollrath	4980210	12	\$ 10.80	\$ 129.60	
98	Ladle, 6 oz	Vollrath	4980610	Vollrath	4980610	4	\$ 17.16	\$ 68.64			4	No Bid		Vollrath	4980610	4	\$ 15.78	\$ 63.12	Vollrath	4980610	4	\$ 14.17	\$ 56.68	
99	Spatula, Metal, 4" Off Set	Dexter Russell	19713H	Stanton Trading	PL7408	6	\$ 4.73	\$ 28.38			6	No Bid		Dexter Russell	19713H	6	\$ 24.31	\$ 145.86	Dexter Russell	19713H	6	\$ 21.95	\$ 131.70	
100	Spatula, Metal, 6" Off Set	Dexter Russell	31645H	Dexter Russell	P94855H	11	\$ 14.32	\$ 157.52			11	No Bid		Dexter Russell	31645H	11	\$ 15.02	\$ 165.22	Dexter Russell	31645H	11	\$ 13.84	\$ 152.24	
101	Spatula, Metal, 8" Off Set	Dexter Russell	19613H	Stanton Trading	PL7408	2	\$ 2.88	\$ 5.76			2	No Bid		Dexter Russell	19613H	2	\$ 26.49	\$ 52.98	Dexter Russell	19613H	2	\$ 23.52	\$ 47.04	
102	Tongs, Metal, 6"	Vollrath	4786010	Vollrath	4786010	17	\$ 5.12	\$ 87.04			17	No Bid		Vollrath	4786010	17	\$ 4.71	\$ 80.07	Webstraunt	4786010	17	\$ 6.57	\$ 111.69	
103	Tongs, Metal, 9"	Vollrath	47309	Stanton Trading	212HD	26	\$ 2.92	\$ 75.92			26	No Bid		Vollrath	47309	26	\$ 3.88	\$ 100.88	Vollrath	47309	26	\$ 3.77	\$ 98.02	
104	Tongs, Metal, 12"	Vollrath	47312	Stanton Trading	214HD	4	\$ 3.73	\$ 14.92			4	No Bid		Vollrath	47312	4	\$ 5.23	\$ 20.92	Vollrath	47312	4	\$ 4.93	\$ 19.72	
105	Serving Spoon, Solid	Vollrath	46945	Stanton Trading	4434	31	\$ 1.24	\$ 38.44			31	No Bid		Vollrath	46945	31	\$ 5.43	\$ 168.33	Vollrath	46945	31	\$ 5.02	\$ 155.62	
106	Serving Spoon, Perforated	Vollrath	46946	Stanton Trading	4438	20	\$ 1.24	\$ 24.80			20	No Bid		Vollrath	46946	20	\$ 5.43	\$ 108.60	Vollrath	46946	20	\$ 5.00	\$ 100.00	
107	Colander, 5 qt	Vollrath	47965	Stanton Trading	6105	3	\$ 4.78	\$ 14.34			3	No Bid		Vollrath	47965	3	\$ 15.99	\$ 47.97	Vollrath	47965	3	\$ 17.96	\$ 53.88	
108	Condiment Bottle, 12 oz	Vollrath	52063	Stanton Trading	307	20	\$ 0.61	\$ 12.20			20	No Bid		Vollrath	52063	20	\$ 1.86	\$ 37.20	Vollrath	52063	20	\$ 2.00	\$ 40.00	
109	Condiment Bottle, 16 oz	Vollrath	4916-13	ABC	CSBW-16-C	10	\$ 0.67	\$ 6.70			10	No Bid		Vollrath	4916-13	10	\$ 2.12	\$ 21.20	Vollrath	4916-13	10	\$ 2.44	\$ 24.40	
110	Funnel, 13 oz	Vollrath	84750	Vollrath	84750	6	\$ 38.93	\$ 233.58			6	No Bid		Vollrath	84750	6	\$ 35.81	\$ 214.86	Vollrath	84750	6	\$ 29.73	\$ 178.38	
111	Mixing Piano Whip, 10 "	Vollrath	47255	Vollrath	47255	5	\$ 10.97	\$ 54.85			5	No Bid		Vollrath	47255	5	\$ 10.09	\$ 50.45	Vollrath	47255	5	\$ 8.98	\$ 44.90	
112	Mixing Piano Whip, 12 "	Vollrath	47256	Vollrath	47256	3	\$ 12.26	\$ 36.78			3	No Bid		Vollrath	47256	3	\$ 11.28	\$ 33.84	Vollrath	47256	3	\$ 10.03	\$ 30.09	
113	Kitchen Shears	Mercer Culinary	M33042P	TableCraft	10995	42	\$ 5.91	\$ 248.22			42	No Bid		Mercer Culinary	M33042P	42	\$ 15.01	\$ 630.42	Mercer Culinary	M33042P	42	\$ 18.87	\$ 792.54	
114	Vegetable Peeler	OXO	1061242	Stanton Trading	491	15	\$ 0.93	\$ 13.95			15	No Bid		OXO	1061242	15	\$ 14.15	\$ 212.25	OXO	1061242	15	\$ 14.71	\$ 220.65	
115	Egg Slicer, Aluminum w/Stainless steel wires	any		ABC	ESA-1	10	\$ 4.27	\$ 42.70			10	No Bid		Vollrath	47040	10	\$ 9.73	\$ 97.30	Vollrath	47040	10	\$ 8.68	\$ 86.80	
116	Knife, 8" Chefs	Mercer Culinary	M23510	Mercer Culinary	M23510	14	\$ 48.48	\$ 678.72			14	No Bid		Mercer Culinary	M23510	14	\$ 48.17	\$ 674.38	Mercer Culinary	M23510	14	\$ 60.06	\$ 840.84	
117	Knife, 10" Chefs	Mercer Culinary	M23530	Mercer Culinary	M23530	24	\$ 53.24	\$ 1,277.76			24	No Bid		Mercer Culinary	M23530	24	\$ 52.90	\$ 1,269.60	Mercer Culinary	M23530	24	\$ 65.78	\$ 1,578.72	
118	Knife, Scalloped, Off set	Mercer Culinary	M22408	Mercer Culinary	M22408	4	\$ 14.48	\$ 57.92			4	No Bid		Mercer Culinary	M22408	4	\$ 14.38	\$ 57.52	Mercer Culinary	M22408	4	\$ 18.50	\$ 74.00	
119	Knife, Paring	Mercer Culinary	M23540	Mercer Culinary	M23540	63	\$ 21.98	\$ 1,384.74			63	No Bid		Mercer Culinary	M23540	63	\$ 21.84	\$ 1,375.92	Mercer Culinary	M23540	63	\$ 27.12	\$ 1,708.56	
120	Knife, wave edge, deli	Mercer Culinary	M20508	Mercer Culinary	M20508	10	\$ 30.40	\$ 304.00			10	No Bid		Mercer Culinary	M20508	10	\$ 30.20	\$ 302.00	Mercer Culinary	M20508	10	\$ 37.98	\$ 379.80	
121	Sharpener	Wusthof	3169730101	Stanton Trading	7920	16	\$ 7.74	\$ 123.84			16	No Bid		Wusthof	3169730101	16	\$ 41.30	\$ 660.80	Webstraunt	3169730101	16	\$ 41.11	\$ 657.76	
122	Bakers Spatula, 6"	Dexter-Russell	17413	Dexter Russell	S284-6	6	\$ 11.64	\$ 69.84			6	No Bid		Dexter-Russell	17413	6	\$ 12.21	\$ 73.26	Dexter-Russell	17413	6	\$ 10.83	\$ 64.98	
123	Bakers Spatula, 10"	Dexter-Russell	19823	Dexter Russell	S284-10PCP	2	\$ 18.53	\$ 37.06			2	No Bid		Dexter-Russell	19823	2	\$ 19.44	\$ 38.88	Dexter-Russell	19823	2	\$ 17.37	\$ 34.74	
124	Cutting Board, Full, White, Polyethylene	any		Stanton Trading	799-182475	14	\$ 24.37	\$ 341.18			14	No Bid		Winco	CWBT-1824	14	\$ 17.42	\$ 243.88	Webstraunt	40724185WH	14	\$ 18.22	\$ 255.08	
125	Cutting Board, 1/2, White, Polyethylene	any		Stanton Trading	799-18	24	\$ 7.74	\$ 185.76			24	No Bid		Winco	CWBT-1218	24	\$ 8.35	\$ 200.40	Webstraunt	40718125WH	24	\$ 8.03	\$ 192.72	
126	Sheet Pan, Full, 18" x 26", Wire in Rim	Vollrath	9002	Stanton Trading	1018	119	\$ 11.36	\$ 1,351.84			119	No Bid		Winco	ALXP-1826	119	\$ 10.75	\$ 1,279.25	Vollrath	9002	119	\$ 14.57	\$ 1,733.83	
127	Sheet Pan, 1/2 size, 13" x 18"	Vollrath	5303	Stanton Trading	1017	141	\$ 6.28	\$ 885.48			141	No Bid		Winco	ALXP-1318	141	\$ 6.08	\$ 857.28	Vollrath	5303	141	\$ 9.87	\$ 1,391.67	
128	Rapid Cooling Paddle, 2L	San Jamar	RCU64	San Jamar	RCU64	4	\$ 38.19	\$ 152.76			4	No Bid		San Jamar	RCU64	4	\$ 39.87	\$ 159.48	San Jamar	RCU64	4	\$ 35.61	\$ 142.44	
129	Pastry Brush, Nylon Bristle	Carlisle	4040102	Carlisle	4040102	12	\$ 10.58	\$ 126.96			12	No Bid		Carlisle	4040102	12	\$ 10.85	\$ 130.20	Carlisle	4040102	12	\$ 11.02	\$ 132.24	
130	Aprons, pocketed & thermometer pocket	Uncommon Thread	3127	Sam Tell & Sons	3901	31	\$ 17.06	\$ 528.86			31	No Bid		Winco	BA-PBK	31	\$ 4.97	\$ 154.07	Webstraunt	3127	31	\$ 15.65	\$ 485.15	
131	Oven Mitts, each	San Jamar	KM17	Stanton Trading	9946L	80	\$ 4.33	\$ 346.40			80	No Bid		San Jamar	KM17	80	\$ 30.61	\$ 2,448.80	San Jamar	KM17	80	\$ 27.62	\$ 2,209.60	
132	Sleeve protector	Condor	INXN1	San Jamar	SLWT16	15	\$ 9.63	\$ 144.45			15	No Bid		FMP	13-1600	15	\$ 6.42	\$ 96.30	Zoro	INXN1	15	\$ 5.48	\$ 82.20	
133	Knife Glove, Level A5	Mercer Culinary	M33413	Mercer Culinary	M33413	11	\$ 6.11	\$ 67.21			11	No Bid		Mercer Culinary	M33413	11	\$ 6.07	\$ 66.77	Mercer Culinary	M33413	11	\$ 7.71	\$ 84.81	
134	Striped Bar Towel, 12 pack	Chef's Revival	15" X 26"	John Ritzenhale	HT115GS	25	\$ 25.75	\$ 643.75			25	No Bid		Chef's Revival	HT115GS	25	\$ 22.93	\$ 573.25	Webstraunt	705MSK	25	\$ 21.24	\$ 531.00	