

Bid Tabulation

7/5/2016

RFP #2016-63, Provide Electricity to the Electric Distribution Company for the FACPC (Allegany Co. BOE, Garrett Co. BOE, Garrett Co. Government, and Washington County BOE)

	FACPC Aggregated Prices				Individual Agency Prices - ALTERNATES				
	Base Bid I - All FACPC Accounts- Including Adventure Park	Base Bid II All FACPC Accounts - Excluding Adventure Park	Base Bid IA - All FACPC Accounts using 25% Renewables	Info Price - Same as Base Bid I, Except Excluding WCPS Solar Accts.	Alt. 1 Allegany County Board of Education	Alt. 2. Garrett County Board of Education	Alt. 3 Garrett County Government	Alt. 4 Washington County Board of Education	Alt. 5 Adventure Sports Park
November 2016 MRD - November 2017 MRD (12 Months)									
Energy	0.0597	0.0592	NO BID	0.0597	0.0581	0.0573	0.0606	0.0601	0.0993
Direct Energy	0.05726	0.05702	0.0577	0.05726	0.05642	0.0565	0.05936	0.05708	0.07666
Talen Energy	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
WGL Energy Services	0.05984	0.05884	0.05917	0.05984	0.05761	0.0577	0.06192	0.05904	0.05076
November 2016 MRD - November 2018 MRD (24 Months)									
Energy	0.0614	0.0609	NO BID	0.0613	0.0596	0.0586	0.0625	0.0618	0.113
Direct Energy	0.05811	0.05778	0.05859	0.05813	0.05719	0.05719	0.06042	0.05785	0.08445
Talen Energy	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
WGL Energy Services	0.05974	0.05974	0.06008	0.05974	0.05835	0.05821	0.0631	0.05983	0.05078
November 2016 MRD - November 2019 MRD (36 Months)									
Energy	0.0614	0.0608	NO BID	0.0613	0.0595	0.0587	0.0625	0.0618	0.1147
Direct Energy	0.05788	<b>0.05753</b>	0.0584	0.05794	0.05693	0.05696	0.06017	0.05767	0.08489
Talen Energy	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
WGL Energy Services	0.05945	0.05945	0.0598	0.05945	0.05805	0.05789	0.06279	0.05956	NO BID
November 2016 MRD - May 2020 MRD (42 Months)									
Energy	0.0617	0.061	NO BID	0.0615	0.0595	0.0588	0.0627	0.062	0.1215
Direct Energy	0.0579	0.0575	0.0584	0.0579	0.0569	0.0569	0.0601	0.0577	0.088
Talen Energy	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
WGL Energy Services	0.05928	0.05928	0.05964	0.05928	0.05792	0.05767	0.06258	0.0594	NO BID
Note: MRD is "Meter Read Date"									