

Bid Tabulation - Bid #2016-37, Heating Oil

BASE BID - FLOAT WITH MARKET								
		PAPCO, Inc.	East River Energy, Inc.	James River Solutions	A C & T Co., Inc.	Petroleum Traders Corp.	Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.	Space Petroleum, a division of IPC (USA), Inc.
	Estimated Annual Quantities (Gallons)	Aston, PA	Guilford, CT	Ashland, VA	Hagerstown, MD	Fort Wayne, IN	Gainesville, GA	Columbia, MD
Tankwagon		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		
Washington County Public Schools	6,200			\$0.1450	\$0.1490		\$0.3203	\$0.3623
Washington County Government	66,000			\$0.1450	\$0.1490		\$0.3203	\$0.3594
The City of Hagerstown	43,100			\$0.1450	\$0.1490		\$0.3203	\$0.3594
Carroll County Public Schools	0			N/A	N/A		\$0.3203	\$0.1720
Aggregate (Combined) Total	115,300			\$0.1450			\$1.2812	No Bid
Transport Carrier								
Washington County Public Schools	176,900	\$0.0428	\$0.0334	\$0.0185	\$0.0625	\$0.0038	\$0.0803	\$0.0189
Washington County Government	0	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$0.0803	\$0.0189
The City of Hagerstown	0	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$0.0803	\$0.0189
Carroll County Public Schools	235,200	\$0.0169	\$0.0334	\$0.0185	\$0.0775	minus \$0.0201	\$0.0579	\$0.0104
Aggregate (Combined) Total	412,100	\$0.0280		\$0.0185	No Bid	minus \$0.0114	\$0.2988	No Bid
Taxes included in Bidder's Factor:		Fed Oil Spill \$0.0019/gl.; Md. Oil Transfer \$0.0019/gl.	Fed Oil Spill \$0.0019/gl.; Md. Oil Transfer \$0.001369/gl.; NORA \$0.0020/gl.; LUST \$0.0010/gl	Fed LUST \$0.0010/gl. NORA \$0.0020/gl.	Fed Environ. Fee \$0.0019/gl.; Md. Environ. Fee \$0.0019/gl.; NORA \$0.002/gl.; LUST \$0.001/gl		N/A	NONE

Bid Tabulation - Bid #2016-37, Heating Oil

	PAPCO, Inc.	East River Energy, Inc.	James River Solutions	A C & T Co., Inc.	Petroleum Traders Corp.	Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.	Space Petroleum, a division of IPC (USA), Inc.
Taxes NOT included in Bidder's Factor but will be Added to Invoices:	Fed. LUST \$0.0010/gl.; NORA \$0.0020/gl.	None	Any additional applicable taxes	None	Fed Oil Spill \$0.0019/gl.; Md. Transfer \$0.001905/gl.; NORA \$0.0020/gl.; LUST \$0.0010/gl	Fed Oil Spill \$0.0019/gl.; Md. Environ. \$0.001905/gl.; NORA \$0.002/gl.; LUST \$0.001/gl	Fed Oil Spill \$0.0019/gl.; Md. Transfer \$0.0019/gl.; NORA \$0.0020/gl.; LUST \$0.0010/gl
OPIS Price on Feb. 25, 2016	\$1.0786	\$1.0786	\$1.0786	\$1.0786	\$1.0762	\$1.0786	\$1.0786
Major Oil Refiner	Valero, PES, Exxon, Shell Marathon, Phillips and Others	Valero, Motiva, Buckeye, Apex	Multiple, Buckeye, Shell, etc.	Motiva	Various: Apex, Motiva, Enterprises, Buckeye, Southern States and United Energy	Sunoco	
NYMEX Info. Price	\$1.2592 on Feb. 25		\$1.4755/gl. Tank; \$1.349/gl. Transport		N/A		
Split Load Fee/Drop	\$85 within 10 Miles of Initial Drop		\$20.00		\$50.00		\$65.00
2 Addenda Received	✓	✓ (Add 1 Only)	✓		✓	✓ (Add 1 Only)	✓
Bid Affidavit	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Subcontractor	Petro Express as Fuel Hauler		N/A				Elite Tank Lines, Petro Express for Hauler
References	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓

Bid Tabulation - Bid #2016-37, Heating Oil

OPTIONAL ALTERNATE BID - FLOAT 25% FIXED PRICE 75% - Aggregate of WCPS, WCG, City of Hagerstown and CCPS									
	PAPCO, Inc.			James River Solutions, Inc.			Petroleum Traders Corp.		
	Aston, PA			Ashland, VA			Fort Wayne, IN		
	75% Fixed Price	25% Spot Price	25% Spot - Bidder's Factor	75% Fixed Price	25% Spot Price	25% Spot - Bidder's Factor	75% Fixed Price	25% Spot Price	25% Spot - Bidder's Factor
Tankwagon (115,300 Gallons)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.4755	\$1.2236	\$0.1450	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Transport Carrier (412,100 Gallons)	\$ 1.3736	\$1.1066	\$0.0280	\$1.3490	\$1.0971	\$0.0185	\$1.4588	\$1.0648	Minus .0114/gal.
Taxes included:	Fed Oil Spill \$0.0019/gl.; Md. Oil Transfer \$0.0019/gl.			Fed. LUST \$0.0010/gl.; NORA \$0.0020/gl.					
Taxes NOT included but added to invoices:	Fed. LUST \$0.0010/gl.; NORA \$0.0020/gl.			Any applicable taxes			Fed Oil Spill \$0.0019/gl.; Md. Transfer \$0.001905/gl.; NORA \$0.002/gl.; LUST \$0.001/gl		
Major Oil Refiner	Valero, PES, Exxon, Shell Marathon, Phillips and Others			Multiple suppliers- Buckeye, Shell, Etc.			Various: Apex, Motiva, Enterprises, Buckeye, Southern States and United Energy		
Split Load Fee/Drop	\$85 within 10 Miles of Initial Drop			\$20.00			\$50.00		
Subcontractors	Petro Express (fuel hauler)			N/A					
Miscellaneous Notes	See critical notes page of bid regarding fixed price offer.								
2 Addenda Received	√			√			√		
Bid Affidavit	√			√			√		
References	√			√			√		