

**Bid Tabulation #2015-35  
Office Papers and Envelopes**

	Description & Specified Product	Specification	Cartons	Impact Office Beltsville, MD				WB Mason York, PA				B.W. Wilson Paper Company, Inc. Richmond, VA				Xpedx, LLC, A Veritiv Company Camp Hill, PA			
				Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year
1	Multipurpose White Paper, 8 1/2 X 11", Xpedex - Vector - MFG # 095347 or Equal	20 pound, 92 brightness, 8.5" x 11", 10M, White, Multi Purpose (10 reams of 500 sheets or 5,000 sheets per carton)	8220	IMP851192		\$ 26.65	\$ 219,063.00	WBM21200	√	\$ 28.19	\$ 231,721.80	GP Spectrum 999705		\$ 26.45	\$ 217,419.00	2368365	√	\$ 25.22	\$ 207,308.40
2	Multipurpose White Paper, 11 X 17"	20 pound, 11" x 17", 20M White (2,500 sheets per carton)	120	FCPS010453	*wrote 6.89	\$ 34.45	\$ 4,134.00	WBM28110	√	\$ 29.30	\$ 3,516.00	GP Spectrum 999812L2		\$ 29.25	\$ 3,510.00	2251793	Vector	\$ 28.97	\$ 3,476.40
3	Multipurpose WHITE Paper, 8 1/2 X 14"	20 pound, 8.5" x 14", 12M, White (10 reams of 500/5,000 sheets per carton)	15	MOH14		\$ 44.29	\$ 664.35	WBM24200	√	\$ 38.97	\$ 584.55	GP Spectrum 999706		\$ 37.25	\$ 558.75	2251794	Vector	\$ 36.85	\$ 552.75
4	Multipurpose WHITE Paper, 8 1/2 X 11"	24 pound, 8.5" x 11, 12.72M, White (10 reams of 500/5,000 sheets per carton)	15	21022454		\$ 41.83	\$ 627.45	STR91200CT	√	\$ 36.93	\$ 553.95	GP Spectrum 999707		\$ 32.00	\$ 480.00	5347289	Soporcel	\$ 37.29	\$ 559.35
5	Cover Paper - BLUE - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 026000 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 8.5" x 11", BLUE, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 2,000/carton,	125	SH026000		\$ 38.82	\$ 4,852.50	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81042		\$ 31.85	\$ 3,981.25	2288955	√	\$ 29.47	\$ 3,683.75
6	Cover Paper - BLUE - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 026004 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 11" x 17", BLUE, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 1,000/carton,	8	SH026004		\$ 41.83	\$ 334.64	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81003		\$ 33.45	\$ 267.60	2288956	√	\$ 31.20	\$ 249.60
7	Cover Paper - CANARY- International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 036000 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 8.5" x 11", Canary, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 2,000/carton,	130	SH036000		\$ 38.82	\$ 5,046.60	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81044		\$ 31.85	\$ 4,140.50	2288958	√	\$ 29.47	\$ 3,831.10
8	Cover Paper - CANARY - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 036004 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 11" x 17", Canary, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 1,000/carton,	8	SH036004		\$ 41.83	\$ 334.64	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81004		\$ 33.45	\$ 267.60	2288959	√	\$ 31.20	\$ 249.60
9	Cover Paper- GREEN- International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 046000 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 8.5" x 11", Green, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 2,000/carton,	110	SH046000		\$ 38.82	\$ 4,270.20	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81040		\$ 31.85	\$ 3,503.50	2288961	√	\$ 29.47	\$ 3,241.70
10	Cover Paper- GREEN - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 046004 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 11" x 17", Green, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 1,000/carton,	6	SH046004		\$ 41.83	\$ 250.98	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81002		\$ 33.45	\$ 200.70	2288962	√	\$ 31.20	\$ 187.20
11	Cover Paper- GREEN - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 046055 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 23" x 35", Green, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 500 sht/carton,	8	SH046055		\$ 81.19	\$ 649.52	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81124		\$ 69.75	\$ 558.00	2023474	√	\$ 72.65	\$ 581.20
12	Cover Paper - GOLDENROD - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 086008 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 8.5" x 11", Goldenrod, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 2,000/carton,	25	SH086008		\$ 38.83	\$ 970.75	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81057		\$ 31.85	\$ 796.25	2288974	√	\$ 29.47	\$ 736.75
13	Cover Paper - GRAY - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 066000 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 8.5" x 11", Gray, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 2,000/carton,	2	SH066000		\$ 38.83	\$ 77.66	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81043		\$ 31.85	\$ 63.70	2288969	√	\$ 29.47	\$ 58.94

**Bid Tabulation #2015-35  
Office Papers and Envelopes**

	Description & Specified Product	Specification	Cartons	Impact Office Beltsville, MD				WB Mason York, PA				B.W. Wilson Paper Company, Inc. Richmond, VA				Xpedx, LLC, A Veritiv Company Camp Hill, PA				
				Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	
14	Cover Paper - IVORY - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 056000 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 8.5" x 11", Ivory, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 2,000/carton,	18	SH056000		\$ 38.83	\$ 698.94	No Bid			\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81046		\$ 31.85	\$ 573.30	2288964	√	\$ 29.47	\$ 530.46
15	Cover Paper - IVORY - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 056004 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 11" x 17", Ivory, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 1,000/carton,	5	SH056004		\$ 41.83	\$ 209.15	No Bid			\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81005		\$ 33.45	\$ 167.25	2288965	√	\$ 31.20	\$ 156.00
16	Cover Paper - ORCHID - (BLUE/PURPLE)- International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 057000 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 8.5" x 11", ORCHID (Blue/Purple), 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 2,000/carton,	47	SH057000		\$ 38.82	\$ 1,824.54	No Bid			\$ -	\$ -	Neenah Exact 82421		\$ 35.00	\$ 1,645.00	2288967	√	\$ 29.47	\$ 1,385.09
17	Cover Paper - PINK - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 076000 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 8.5" x 11", Pink, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 2,000/carton,	68	SH076000		\$ 38.82	\$ 2,639.76	No Bid			\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81041		\$ 31.85	\$ 2,165.80	2288971	√	\$ 29.47	\$ 2,003.96
18	Cover Paper - PINK - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 076004 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 11" x 17", Pink, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 1,000/carton,	6	SH076004		\$ 41.83	\$ 250.98	No Bid			\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81007		\$ 33.45	\$ 200.70	6054475	√	\$ 31.20	\$ 187.20
19	Cover Paper - PEACH - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 058000 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 8.5" x 11", Peach, 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 2,000/carton,	38	SH058000		\$ 38.83	\$ 1,475.54	No Bid			\$ -	\$ -	Neenah Exact 82451		\$ 35.00	\$ 1,330.00	2288968	√	\$ 29.47	\$ 1,119.86
20	Cover Paper - WHITE - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 016000 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 8.5" x 11", White, 92 brightness, 95 opacity, 8.8 caliper, 325 smoothness; 10% PCW, SFI Certified, 2,000/carton,	285	SH016000		\$ 36.86	\$ 10,505.10	No Bid			\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81036		\$ 30.25	\$ 8,621.25	2288916	√	\$ 27.74	\$ 7,905.90
21	Cover Paper, 11 X 17" -WHITE - International Paper's Springhill - MFG # 016004 or Equal	Vellum Bristol Cover, uncoated, 67 pound, 11" x 17", WHITE, 92 brightness, 10% PCW, 250 sheets/ream; 1,000 sheets/carton.	65	SH016004		\$ 38.83	\$ 2,523.95	No Bid			\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81000		\$ 31.85	\$ 2,070.25	2288918	√	\$ 29.48	\$ 1,916.20
22	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" - BUFF - International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 103325	8.5" X 11", Color: BUFF, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	26	FCPS001898		\$ 41.50	\$ 1,079.00	No Bid			\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81204		\$ 38.00	\$ 988.00	2001016	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 952.38
23	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" IVORY, International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 103176	8.5" X 11", Color: IVORY, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	21	FCPS001913		\$ 41.50	\$ 871.50				\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81201		\$ 38.00	\$ 798.00	2001023	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 769.23
24	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" - GOLDENROD - International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 103168	8.5" X 11", Color: GOLDENROD+C7, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	75	FCPS001899		\$ 41.50	\$ 3,112.50				\$ -	\$ -	Domtar Earthchoice 81203		\$ 38.00	\$ 2,850.00	2001020	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 2,747.25

**Bid Tabulation #2015-35  
Office Papers and Envelopes**

	Description & Specified Product	Specification	Cartons	Impact Office Beltsville, MD				WB Mason York, PA				B.W. Wilson Paper Company, Inc. Richmond, VA				Xpedx, LLC, A Veritiv Company Camp Hill, PA				
				Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	
25	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" - YELLOW/CANARY - International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 103341	8.5" X 11", Color: Yellow/Canary, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	175	FCPS001902		\$ 41.50	\$ 7,262.50	No Bid					Domtar Earthchoice 81196		\$ 38.00	\$ 6,650.00	2001018	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 6,410.25
26	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" Orchid, International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 103770	8.5" X 11", Color: Orchid (Blue/purple), 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	85	FCPS001914		\$ 41.50	\$ 3,527.50	No Bid					Domtar Earthchoice 81200		\$ 38.00	\$ 3,230.00	2001025	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 3,113.55
27	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" GREEN, International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 103366	8.5" X 11", Color: Green, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	165	FCPS001904		\$ 41.50	\$ 6,847.50	No Bid					Domtar Earthchoice 81197		\$ 38.00	\$ 6,270.00	2001021	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 6,043.95
28	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" - BLUE - International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 103309	8.5" X 11", Color: Blue, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	187	FCPS001903		\$ 41.50	\$ 7,760.50	No Bid					Domtar Earthchoice 81199		\$ 38.00	\$ 7,106.00	2001015	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 6,849.81
29	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" - SALMON - International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 103119	8.5" X 11", Color: SALMON, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	53	FCPS001900		\$ 41.50	\$ 2,199.50	No Bid					Domtar Earthchoice 81206		\$ 38.00	\$ 2,014.00	2001028	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 1,941.39
30	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" - PINK - International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 103382	8.5" X 11", Color: PINK, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	90	FCPS001901		\$ 41.50	\$ 3,735.00	No Bid					Domtar Earthchoice 81198		\$ 38.00	\$ 3,420.00	2001027	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 3,296.70
31	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" - GREY - International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 102889	8.5" X 11", Color: GREY, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	15	FCPS001912		\$ 41.50	\$ 622.50	No Bid					Domtar Earthchoice 81195		\$ 38.00	\$ 570.00	2001022	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 549.45
32	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" - TAN - International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 102863	8.5" X 11", Color: TAN, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	10	FCPS001915		\$ 41.50	\$ 415.00	No Bid					Domtar Earthchoice 81202		\$ 38.00	\$ 380.00	2001029	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 366.30
33	Paper, Multipurpose, 20 lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" - CHERRY - International Paper's Fore MP - MFG # 102210	8.5" X 11", Color: CHERRY, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20 lb. bond; acid free; Basis Weight: 20/50lb. Text (Caliper .0040)	40	FCPS001916		\$ 41.50	\$ 1,660.00	No Bid					Domtar Earthchoice 81205		\$ 38.00	\$ 1,520.00	2001031	√	\$ 36.63	\$ 1,465.20
34	Paper, Multipurpose Laser Cut 3 Hole Left, 20lb.; 8 1/2 X 11" - WHITE - Vector Multipurpose or Equal MFG# 095347	8.5" X 11", Color: WHITE, 500 sheets/package (carton/5000); smooth finish; 20lb; 92 brightness	900	00257		\$ 39.10	\$ 35,190.00	WBM28230	√	\$ 30.09	\$ 27,081.00		GP Spectrum 999813		\$ 28.95	\$ 26,055.00	2251795	√	\$ 28.97	\$ 26,073.00
35	Cover Paper - Gloss - WHITE - Sterling Premium Digital Gloss Cover Cut Size MFG # 283691 or Equal	11" X 17" Color: WHITE - Gloss, 250/sheets (carton/500); 100 lb, 72M, 10% PCW, 94 brightness	6	283651		\$ 35.63	\$ 213.78	No Bid					Prodigital 2207289		\$ 30.00	\$ 180.00	6087845	√	\$ 31.67	\$ 190.02
36	Envelope, regular business, - WHITE - Seville 40444	No. 10 envelope, size 4 1/8" X 9 1/2", sub. 24, white wove, 5 boxes of 500/2500 ctn. 92 brightness; made in USA	90	5510001		\$ 39.93	\$ 3,593.70	No Bid					Printmaster 03982		\$ 39.50	\$ 3,555.00	2256150	√	\$ 39.90	\$ 3,591.00

**Bid Tabulation #2015-35  
Office Papers and Envelopes**

	Description & Specified Product	Specification	Cartons	Impact Office Beltsville, MD				WB Mason York, PA				B.W. Wilson Paper Company, Inc. Richmond, VA				Xpedx, LLC, A Veritiv Company Camp Hill, PA			
				Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year	Bid Product Number	Bid Package As Spec'd? (Y or Note Alt. Pkg.)	Price Per Carton/Box	Extended Total/Year
37	Envelope, window business, WHITE - Seville 40445	No. 10 envelope, size 4 1/8" X 9 1/2", WINDOW, sub. 24, white wove, 5 boxes of 500/box or 2,500 per carton, 92 brightness, made in USA	46	5511001		\$ 46.64	\$ 2,145.44	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Printmaster 04048		\$ 46.00	\$ 2,116.00	2256151	v	\$ 43.38	\$ 1,995.48
38	Envelope, regular business, small, - WHITE - Seville 40468	No. 9 envelope, size 3.875" x 8.875", sub. 24, diagonal seams, white wove, 92 brightness, 500 per box, 2500/ctn.	2	5509001		\$ 38.30	\$ 76.60	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Printmaster 03975		\$ 39.50	\$ 79.00	2256162	v	\$ 37.87	\$ 75.74
39	Envelope, booklet style, - WHITE - 9" X 12" - Seville 40459	No. 9 1/2 envelopes, size 9" X 12", white wove, 92 brightness, sub. 28, open end, 500/ctn.	8	F02082		\$ 50.71	\$ 405.68	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Printmaster 85526		\$ 39.00	\$ 312.00	2256155	v	\$ 24.38	\$ 195.04
40	Envelope, booklet style, - WHITE - 9" X 12" - Seville 40436	No. 9 1/2 envelopes, size 9" X 12", white wove, 92 brightness, sub. 28, wallet flap, side seams, 500/ctn.	2	No Bid			\$ -	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Printmaster 85822		\$ 33.00	\$ 66.00	2256153	v	\$ 21.58	\$ 43.16
41	Envelope, booklet style, - WHITE - 9" X 12" - Seville 40435	No. 9 1/2 envelopes, size 9" X 12", white wove, 92 brightness, sub. 24, wallet flap, side seams, 500/ctn.	80	No Bid			\$ -	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Printmaster 04252		\$ 26.00	\$ 2,080.00	2256154	v	\$ 20.20	\$ 1,616.00
42	Envelope, booklet style, WHITE - 9" X 12" - Seville 40450	No. 10 envelopes, size 4 1/8" X 9 1/2", white wove, 92 brightness, sub. 24, side seams, 500 per box 2500/ctn.	11	551001		\$ 38.30	\$ 421.30	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Printmaster 62709		\$ 41.00	\$ 451.00	2256164	v	\$ 33.90	\$ 372.90
43	Envelope, booklet style, window, - WHITE - 4 1/8" X 9 1/2" - Seville 40451	No. 10 window envelopes, size 4 1/8" X 9 1/2", white wove, 92 brightness, sub. 24, side seams, 500 per box 2500/ctn.	15	5511011		\$ 44.73	\$ 670.95	No Bid		\$ -	\$ -	Printmaster 62715		\$ 44.00	\$ 660.00	2256167	v	\$ 39.39	\$ 590.85
						TOTAL	\$ 342,543.75			TOTAL	\$ 236,376.30			TOTAL	\$ 323,870.40			TOTAL	\$ 309,170.06
						ITEMS BID	41			ITEMS BID	5			ITEMS BID	43			ITEMS BID	43